
GENERAL SERVICE AGENCY 
(Ahensian Setbision Hinirat) 

Government of Guam 
590 South Marie Drive, Ste. 219 ITC Bldg., Tamuning, GU 96913 

Tel: 477-1710-13 Fax: 472-4217 /475-1716/27 

Accountability 
	

Impartiality 	Competence 	Openness 	 Value 

BID STATUS 
September 8, 2021 

JMI-EDISON 
Attn: Jean Grape, Sales Manager 
130 Siket St., 
Tamuning, Guam 96913 
Tel: (671) 646-1256 / 649-5685 
Email: jeangrape@jrniguam.com  

BID INVITATION NO.: GSA-043-21 	 OPENING DATE: August 27, 2021 

WORKSTATION CUBICLES; CHAIRS; AND CONFERENCE TABLE 

The following is the result of the above-mentioned bid. Refer to the items checked below. 

[ ] Cancelled (in its entirety), or partially cancelled due to: 
( ) 	Insufficient funds: 
( ) 	Change of specifications; or 
( ) 	Insufficient number of bidders. 

[X] Rejected due to: 
( 	) 	Late submission of bid; 
( ) 	No bid security or insufficient bid security; 
( ) 	Not meeting the delivery requirement as stated in the IFB; 
( ) 	Non-conformance with requirement of 11-13; 
(X) 	High price 
( ) Others 

REMARKS: Item Nos.: 1.1, 4.1, 5.1, 6.1, and 7.1 

[X] Bid recommended for award: Multiple Awards see attached listing. 

REMARKS: Thank you for your participation with this bid. Please send your authorized representative to 
pickup your original bid status and cashier check/bid bond or Standby Letter of Credit.  

CLA D SAC ALE 
Chief Pro urement Officer 

Please Print 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT COPY (Re-fax to GSA) 

Received By: 

Date: 

Company Name: 

Fax to: 475-1727 or 472-4217 

E-mail to: gsaprocurement@gsadoa.guam.gov  



M80 SYSTEMS INC. USA CONTRACTORS MI EDISON 

Li Workstation - Cubicles (Office) 5 $6,094.45 $30,472.25 NO BID $6,576.00 $32,880.00 

Manuf: HON SUNLINE 

Make/Model: Accelerate Panel System Sunline V1 

Place of Origin: USA China 

Delivery: 12-14 Weeks 160 Days 

2.1 Office Chairs (450Ibs.) 9 $704.40 $6,339.60 $851.70 $7,665.30 $458.00 $4,122.00 

Manuf: HON SAFCO SAFC0 

Make/Model: HLWMBT 3397BL Vue Intensive-Use Task Chair 

Place of Origin: USA USA Taiwan 

Delivery: 12-14 Weeks 60-90 Cal.Days 160 Days 

3.1 Enclosed Workstation - Cubicle 1 	$9,661.50 $9,661.50 	 NO BID $6,704.00 $6,704.00 

Manuf: HON SUNLINE 

Make/Model: Accelerate Panel System Sunline V1 

Place of Origin: USA China 

Delivery: 12-14 Weeks 160 Days 

4.1 L-Shape (Left Side) Return Work Desk 2 NO BID $1,946.50 53,893 00 $1,739.30 $3,478.60 

Manuf: HON SUNLINE 

Make/Model: Concinnity Desking Helas 

Place of Origin: USA China 

Delivery: 12-14 Weeks 160 Days 

5.1 Two (2) Panel Workstation with Single 1 NO BID $3,400.00 $3,400.00 $1,739.30 $1,739.30 

Worksurface Counter SUNLINE 

Manuf: HON Sunline V1 

Make/Model: Accelerate Panel System China 

Place of Origin: USA 160 Days 

Delivery: 12-14 Weeks 

6.1 Conference Table 4 $1,143.74 $4,574.96 $670.00 $2,680.00 $602.80 $2,411.20 

Manuf: HON SAFCO SUNLINE 

Make/Model: Motivate Nesting Table SY1860 Transit 

Place of Origin: USA USA China 

Delivery: 12-14 Weeks 60-90 Cal.Days 160 Days 

7.1 Stackable Conference Chairs (500lbs.) 8 $530.00 $4,240.00 $350.00 $2,800.00 $397.37 $3,178.96 

Manuf: SAECO KFI SUNLINE 

Make/Model: UBER 3492 HTB1040/51365 Diamond (250Ibs) 

Place of Origin: USA USA China 
Delivery: 12-14 Weeks 60-90 Cal.Days 160 Days 

TOTAL AMOUNT OF AWARD: $38,101.35 $3,178.96 $10,826.00 
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