
GENERAL SERVICE AGENCY 
(Ahensian Setbision Hinirat) 

Government of Guam 
148 Route 1 Marine Corps Drive, Piti, Guam 96915 
Tel: 477-1707-10 Fax: 472-4217 /475-1716/27 

Accountability 
	

Impartiality 	Competence 	Openness 	 Value 

BID STATUS 
September 16,2021 

PACIFIC DATA SYSTEMS (PDS) 
Attn: John Day, President/C00 
185 Ilipog Drive, Suite 101 
Maite, Guam 96910 
Tel: (671) 300-0200 / Fax: (671) 300-0265 
Email: www.pdsguam.com  

BID INVITATION NO.: GSA-036-21 	 OPENING DATE: August 18, 2021 

DESKTOP MULTIFUNCTION PRINTER; SCAN DISK 16GB ULTRA USB 3.0 FLASH 
DRIVE; 1TB USB 3.2 GEN 1 EXTERNAL HARDDRIVE; AND PAPER SHREDDER 

The following is the result of the above-mentioned bid. Refer to the items checked below. 

[ I Cancelled (in its entirety), or partially cancelled due to: 
( ) 
	

Insufficient funds: 
( ) 
	

Change of specifications; or 
( 	) 
	

Insufficient number of bidders. 

[X] Rejected due to: 
( ) 	Late submission of bid; 
( ) 	No bid security or insufficient bid security.  
( ) 	Not meeting the delivery requirement as stated in the IFB; 
( ) 	Non-conformance with requirement of IFB; (See Remarks) 
(X) 	High price 
( ) 	Others 

REMARKS: Item nos.: 1.1 thru 4.1 

[X] Bid recommended for: 

Megabyte in the amount of $48,749.40 (Items 1.1, 3.1, & 4.1) 
Compacific in the amount of $566.40 (Item 2.1) 

REMARKS: Thank you for your participation with this bid. Please send your authorized representative to 
pickup your original bid status and cashier check/bid bond or Standby Letter of Credit.  

414- 
1. 	CLAUDIA S. ACFALLE 
‘. 	Chief Procurement Officer 

Please Print 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT COPY (Re-fax to GSA) 

Received By: 

Date: 

Company Name: 	  

Fax to: 475-1727 or 472-4217 

E-mail to: gsaprocurement@gsadoa.guam.gov  



1.1 Desktop Multifunction 

Printer 

2.1 Scan Disk 16GB Ultra USB 

3.0 Flash Drive 

3.1 1T9 USB 3.2 Gen 1 External 

Hard Drive 

4.1 SHREDDER, JAM PROOF 

CROSS CUT 

COMPACIFIC MEGABYTE XEROX CORP. PDS 

50 EA. I 	$684 00 534,200.00 $598.74 $ 	29,937.00 $632.00 $31,600.00 $880.00 $44,000.00 

Manufacturer: HP 

Make/Model: Color Lasedet 

Pro MFP M283fdw 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Manufacturer: Kyocera Doc Solutions 

Make/Model: ECOSYS MSSZ6cdw 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days or less 

Manufacturer: Xerox 

Make/Model: Xerox WC8515 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days or less 

Manufacturer: HP 

Make/Model: HP Color Lasedet 

Pro MFP/M479fdw 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days or less 

60 	I EA I 	$9.44 $566.40 $9.94 $ 	596.40 NO BID $15.00 5900 00 

Manufacturer: SANDISK 

Make/Model: Ultra/SDCZ48-016G-A46 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days 

Manufacturer ShenzhenDisaiying 

Make/Model: Disain T30 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: China 

Delivery: 20 Days or less 

Manufacturer: SanDisk 

Make/Model: SanDisk, Ultra, 16613, 

USB 3.0 Flash Drive 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days or less 

60 	I EA I 	$78.44 $4,706.40 $64.84 $ 	3,890.40 NO BID $75.00 54,500 00 

Manufacturer: SANDISK 

Make/Model: Ultra/5DC248-016G-A46 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days 

Manufacturer: Western Digital Corp. 

Make/Model: WDBUZGOOlOBBK-WESN 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days or less 

Manufacturer: Adata 

Make/Model: HC660 1TB, 2.5" External HDD 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days or less 

50 	I EA I 	$444.00 $22,200.00 $298.44 $ 	14,922.00 NO BID $599.00 $29,950.00 

Manufacturer: FELLOWS 

Make/Model: Powershred 79Ci 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days 

Manufacturer: Dahle 

Make/Model: 22318 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days or less 

Manufacturer: Fellowes 

Make/Model: PowerShredder 79Ci 

Year: 2021 

Place of Origin: USA 

Delivery: 30 Days or less 

TOTAL AMOUNT OF AWARD: $566.40 $ 	48,749.40 
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