
GENERAL SERVICE AGENCY 
(Ahensian Setbision Hinirat) 

Government of Guam 
5905. Marine Corps Drive, Suite 219, Tamuning Guam 96913 

Tel: 477-1710-13 Fax: 472-4217 / 475-1716/27 

Accountability 
	

Impartiality 	Competence 	Openness 	 Value 

BID STATUS 

PACIFIC WASTE SYSTEM, LLC 
Attn: Betty Jo Cruz, 
Admin. Business Manager 
265 Mamis Street 
Tamuning, Guam 96913 
Tel: (671) 646-2267 /Fax: (671) 649-0120 
Email: bjcruz@pacificwastesystems.com  

August 20, 2021 

BID INVITATION NO.: GSA-047-21 	 OPENING DATE: August 20, 2021 

RENTAL OF TRASH BIN/CONTAINERS & PICKUP SERVICES 

The following is the result of the above-mentioned bid. Refer to the items checked below. 

[ 
	

Cancelled (in its entirety), or partially cancelled due to: 
( ) 	Insufficient funds: 
( 	) 	Change of specifications; or 
( 	) 	Insufficient number of bidders. 

[X] Rejected 
( 	) 
( 	) 

due to: 
Late submission of bid; 
No bid security or insufficient bid security; 

( ) Not meeting the delivery requirement as stated in the IFB; 
( ) Non-conformance with requirement of IFB; 
( ) High price 
(X) Others 

REMARKS: No Bid on Items 1.0(a) & (c)- 2.0(a) (c) (e) & (g).  3.0(a) (c) (e) (g).  4.0 thru 9.0 

[X] Bid recommended for award: MULTIPLE AWARD (SEE ATTACHED LISTING) 

REMARKS: Thank you for your participation with this bid. Please send your authorized representative to 
pickup your original bid status and cashier check/bid bond or Standby Letter of Credit.  

4,0 )14 
CLAU IA S. AC ALLE 
Chief Procurement Officer 

Please Print 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT COPY (Re-fax to GSA) 

Received By: 

Date: 

Company Name: 	  

Fax to: 475-1727 or 472-4217 

E-mail to: gsaprocurement@gsadoa.guam.gov  



GSA-047-21 
RENTAL OF TRASH BIN/CONTAINERS & PICK-UP SERVICES 

AWARD LISTING 

PURPOSE: To provide rental of trash bin/containers and pick-up services to the Government of Guam. This 
is an "INDEFINITE QUANTITY BID". Location will be provided upon request and shall be coordinated by 
requesting department/agency. 

TIPPING FEE: 	Tipping fees should be included with the per haul or pick-up. 

ITEM 
NO. 	DESCRIPTION QTY. UOM 

BID AMOUNT PER HAUL 
OR PICK-UP 

Guahan 
Waste: 

Pacific 
Waste: 

1.0 1.5 CU. YD. Container, Front or Back Load 2 EA. 
 Service One (1) time per week (Frontload) $26.40 No Bid 
 Service One (1) time per week (Backload) No Bid $22.80 
 Service Two (2) times per week (Frontload) $29.00 No Bid 
 Service Two (2) times per week (Backload) No Bid $28.80 

$19.50 $20.15 Tipping Fee Charge - Per Haul 

2.0 3 CU. YD. Container, Front or Back Load 10 EA. 
 Service One (1) time per week (Frontload) $29.40 No Bid 
 Service One (1) time per week (Backload) No Bid $24.95 
 $38.60 No Bid Service two (2) times per week (Frontload) 
 Service two (2) times per week (Backload) No Bid $35.20 
 Service three (3) times per week (Frontload) $46.45 No Bid 

f Service three (3) times per week (Backload) No Bid $41.90 
 $56.90 No Bid Service four (4) times per week (Frontload) 
 Service four (4) times per week (Backload) No Bid $49.40 

$39.00 $39.90 Tipping Fee Charge - Per Haul 

3.0 6 CU. YD. Container, Front or Back Load 1 EA. 

 Service One (1) time per week (Frontload) $42.56 No Bid 
 Service One (1) time per week (Backload) No Bid $38.70 
 Service two (2) times per week (Frontload) $55.60 No Bid 
 Service two (2) times per week (Backload) No Bid $48.80 
 Service three (3) times per week (Frontload) $67.60 No Bid 

 Service three (3) times per week (Backload) No Bid $55.50 
 Service four (4) times per week (Frontload) $74.40 No Bid 
 Service four (4) times per week (Backload) Not Bid $61.90 

$78.00 $74.20 Tipping Fee Charge - Per Haul 



ITEM 
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY. UOM 

BID AMOUNT PER HAUL 
OR PICK-UP 

Guahan Pacific 
Waste: Waste: 

4.0 24 CU. YD. Container, Roll Off Refuse Truck 1 EA. 
(For regular daily trash debris materials) 

 Service One (1) time per week $159.50 No Bid 
 Service Two (2) times per week $318.00 No Bid 

$450.00 Tipping Fee Charge - Per Haul 

5.0 30 CU. YD. Container, Roll Off Refuse Truck 1 EA. 
(For: Metal Only) 

 Service One (1) time per week $155.00 No Bid 
 Service Two (2) times per week $310.00 No Bid 

$450.00 Tipping Fee Charge - Per Haul 

6.0 35 CU. YD. Container, Roll Off Refuse Truck 1 EA. 
(For: Metal Only) 

 Service One (1) time per week $165.00 No Bid 
 Service Two (2) times per week $330.00 No Bid 

$525.00 Tipping Fee Charge - Per Haul 

7.0 30 CU. YD. Container, Roll Off Refuse Truck 1 EA. 
(For: Wood Only) 

 Service One (1) time per week $165.00 No Bid 
 Service Two (2) times per week $330.00 No Bid 

$ 450.00 Tipping Fee Charge - Per Haul 

8.0 35 CU. YD. Container, Roll Off Refuse Truck 1 EA. 
(For: Wood Only) 

 Service One (1) time per week $175.00 No Bid 
 Service Two (2) times per week $350.00 No Bid 

$525.00 Tipping Fee Charge - Per Haul 



ITEM 	 BID AMOUNT PER HAUL 
NO. DESCRIPTION 	 QTY. UOM OR PICK-UP 

Guahan 	Pacific 
Waste: 	Waste: 

9.1 	10 CU. YD. ROLL OFF/ON (COVERED BIN) 10 EA. 
(For: Cardboard Recycle Service Only) 

a. 	Service One (1) time per week $125.00 	No Bid 

  

10.1 OPTIONAL 
TRASH BIN LOCKS 

1 	EA. $25.00 	S50.00 

    

**Note: Price increase maybe requested on Tipping Fee Charges if mandated by 
law. 
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