INVITATION FOR BID
ISSUING OFFICE:
GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY
4 4 GOVERNMENT OF GUAM
Z..r o Yl 148 ROUTE 1, MARINE DRIVE
) CLAUDIA S. ACFALLE PITI, GUAM 96015
Chief Procurement Officer
DATE ISSUED: September 14, 2020 BID INVITATION NO: GSA-046-20
BID FOR OFFICE SUPPLIES

SPECIFICATION: SEE ATTACHED

DESTINATION: GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY (DOA)

REQUIRED DELIVERY DATE: 60 Days Upon Receipt of Purchase Order. For = period of One (1) year on
an as needed basis upon availability of funds. This is an indefinite quantity bid.

INSTRUCTION TO BIDDERS:
1 INDICATE WHETHER: X INDIVIDUAL PARTNERSHIP CORPORATION
INCORPORATED IN: Guam

This bid shall be submitted in duplicaic and sealed to the issuing office above no fater than (Time) 9:00 AM, Bte: 9/29/20 and shall be publicly
opened.  Bid submived ofier the time and date specified nbove shall be rejected.  See ottached General Terms ond Conditions, and Sealed Bid

Solicitation for details.

The undersigned offers and sgrees 1o fumish within the time specificd, the articles and services ot e price stated opposite Ihe respective items lisied on
the schedule provided, unless otherwise specificd by the bidder.  In consideration 1o the expense of the Govemment in opening. tubulating, and
cvaluating this and other hids, and other considerntions, the undersigred agrees that this bid remair finm and imevocable within 98 catendar doys from

the fate opening to supply any or oll the items which prices are guoted.

NAME AND ADDRESS OF BIDDER: SIGNATURE ANB-FITLE OF PERSON
Chelsea Luo AUTHORIZED TO SIGN THIS BID:

979 Army Drive, PMB 109 /s

Barrigada, Guam 96913

AWARD: CONTRACT NO.;: GSA-046-20 AMOUNPI5,876.00  pATE:
ITEM NO(S). AWARDED: 6.1, 13.1, 23.1, 24.1, 25.1, 27.1, 37.1, &1.1, #3.1,

50.1, 57.1, 60.1, 75.1, 81.1, 83.1, 87.1, 88.1, 96.1, 103.} & 106.1

. CLAUDIA S. ACFALLE
Chicf Procurement Officer

NAME AND ADDRESS OF CONTRACTOR: SIGNATLRE AND TITLE OF PERSON
AUTHORIZED TO SIGN THIS CONTRACT:
Chelsea Luo /Yong Luo

= /,4%/9
979 Army Drive, PMB 109 / ong Luo/Owner

Barrigada, Guam 96913
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UNIT PRICE
Qry uam PRICE EXTENSION

s 0.85 s 170.00

ITEM
NO. __ DESCRIPTION

1.1 BATTERY, AA ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG 200 _PG
5613500883

Bidding On
Make: AA Battervy

Stack Number;_ 27838
Brand:_ Panasonic

Date of Delivery: Ag Specified

2.1  BATTERY, AAA ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG 200 PG
5613500814

¢ 0.85 $‘I70.DOJ

Bidding On

Stack Number:_27855
Brand:__Panasonic
Dateof Delivery;_ As Specified

3.1  BATTERY, C ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG 100 PG s 4.00 5. 400.00

5613500884

Bidding On
Make: C Battery

Stock Number:__ 220259

Brand: Duracell

Date of Delivery:__p s Specified

4.1  BATTERY, D ENERG AlLKAL, 2/PG 100 PG $
5613500003

4.00 400.00

Bidding On
Make: -~ D Battery

Stock Number:_ 220258
Brand: Duracell

Date of Delivery,_ As Specified

5.1  BINDER VIEW 2" WHITE 100 EA $
5751001196 _

2.60 $260.00

Bidding O . . .
ﬁ;ﬁg_n\flew Binder 2" white

Stock Number:_ 3157
Brand: Bazic
Date of Belivery;__As_Specified
g 5} BINDER VIEW 1-1/2" BLACK 100 EA S 1.60 [ 160.00
5751001200
Bidding On

Make: View Binder 1.5" Black

Stock Number:_ 3147
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: A« Specified
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ITEM

DESCRIPTION qQry uom

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

NO.

131 |

14.1

15.1

16.1

17.1

181

CLIP STANDARD # 1, 100/Bx 200 BX
5751000052

Bidding On
Make:  Paper Clip #1

Stock Number;_ 99063 -1

Brand: _ Gepmes .
Date of Delivery:_A,s__s_pe_ciﬁ ed

CLIP, DBL. MiNI COLOR ASSORTED 200 BX

24/BX
5751001250

Bidding On _
Make: Paper Clip Color Mini

Stock Number:__ 31024
Brand: QT C

Date of Dellvery;_p g Specified

CLIP, DBL, 1-1/2" X 5x8 200 BX
AS50RTED COLOR MED, 12/BX
5751001249

Bidding On
Make: Paper Clip Color Medium

Stock Number: 31029
Brand: OoIC

Date of Delivery: As Specified

CLIP, DBL, 1/2” X 3x8 200 BX
ASSORTED COLOR S5M, 12/BX
5751001248

Bidding On
Make: Paper Clip Color Small

Stock Number 31028
Brand: OIC

Dateof Delivery:_ Ag Specified

CLIP, DBL 1/4” MINI BLACK 200 BX

12/BX,
5751001193

Bidding On
Make: Paper Clip Black Black

Stock Number;_ 000807
Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery:_ Ags Specified

CLIP, DBL 2 200 BX
ASSORTED COLOR LG. 12/BX -_
5751001251

Bidding On
Make: Paper Clip Color Large

Stock Number;__ 65363
Brand; Business Source

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

s 0.40

s 4.50

s 80.00

590.00
S

790.00

s 590.00

70.00

¢ 200.00
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ITEM

ary uomM

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

ND.

19.1

20.1

21.1

22.1

- 23.1

24.1

ENVELOPE WHITE # 10

DESCRIPTION

CLIPBOARD LEGAL SIZE; WOOD 20 EA
5752000004

8idding On .
Make:___Clipboard Legal

Stock Number;__-1804
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: As Specified

CLIPBOARD LETTER SIZE WOOD 20 EA
5751000006

Bidding O ‘
_'_QE‘“EClipboard Letter

Make;
Stock Number;_ 1803

Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery; A5 Specified

DISC, CD BLANK 500 EA

5583500595

Bidding On
CD-R

Make;
Stock Number;__/ /959U

Brand: Verbatim '
Date of Delivery: As _Specified §

DISPENSER, TAPE 1-1/2 500 MODEL 20 EA
5752000060

Bidding On . »
Make: Tape Dispenser Large 3" "Core

Stock Number: 3300
Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

DISPENSER, TAPE UP TO 1" 3M 20
C-25 .
5752000433

EA

§.1.50

¢ 1.30

3 6.00

Bidding On .
SR SN Tape Dispenser Medium 1" Core

Make;
Stock Number;__ 33710
Brand: Genmes

Date of Dellvery:_As Specified

100 BX

SELF SEAL PLAIN 500/BX
5753000811

Bidding On . _
Make: #10 Envelopes Plain White
Stock Number:___* ' % 5064

8rand; y ~ - Bazic

Date ofDeiiveﬁ: As Specified

s 12.00

¢ 30.00

526.00

110.00

120,00

36.00

¢ 1200.00
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\

.

-

' 27.1 /ENVEL. 10"X13”INTER-DEPT./MESS

Make: Catalog Envelopes, Kraft

Stock Number:__ 41460
Brand: Quality Park

Date of Delivery.__As Specified

50 BX

" 100/8X
5753009839

32.00

Bidding On ;
Inter-Office Envelopes, Kraft

Make:
Stock Number:_ 63561 -/
Brand:___ Quality Park

Date of Delivery:__As Specified

28.1 ENVELOPE CLASP 7X10 KRAFT 50

100/8X
5753000598

BX

Bidding On
Make:____Clasp Envelope
Stock Number:__ 37868

Brand: Quality Park

Date of Delivery: AS Specified

29.1 ERASER, WHITEBOARD 5" 20 EA

5751001259

Bidding On ,
Whiteboard Eraser

Make:
Stock Number; 2229 —_—
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

30.1 FASTENER W/BASE 2", 50/8X 200
5751000136

BX

Bidding On
Make: Fasteners

Stock Number:_ 7017
Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

$ 22.00

ITEM UNIT PRICE
NO.___DESCRIPTION aTY YoM PRICE EXTENSION
. o . 50.0
[ 251 ) ENVELOPE WINDOW # 10 100 BX S 19.50 S 1950.00
‘ .- SELF SEAL WINDOW WHITE 500/8X
5753000810 P
Bidding On
Make; #10 Envelopes,Wind6w
Stock Number;__ 5456
Brand: . _Razid--. . “
Date of Delivery; Ag Specified —_—
26.1 ENVELOPE 9X12 50 BX $.35.00 s 1750.00
OPEN/KRAFT 250/BX CAT.
$753000087
Bidding On

1600.00
S

51']00.00

30.00
$

400.00
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ITEM

UNIT
DESCRIPTION ary_ ucwM PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

NO.

e

38.1

39.1

40.1

41.1

42.1

FOLDER MANILA LTR BLUE 100 BX $_17.00
100/BX
$751000935

Bidding O
N;ak:ar:I *Blue Folder Letter

Stack Number: 4210-1 /3BL.1I
Brand.___Pendaflex
Date of Delivery;__AS Specified

25.00
FOLDER LTR GOLDENROD 100/BX 100 BX S

5751000933

Bidding On .
Make: Goldenrod Folder letter

Stock Number;_ 12234
Brand: ad

__Smead
Date of Delivery:_Ag Specified

FOLDER MANILA LTR GRAY 100 BX
100/8X
5751000936

¢ 17.00

Bidding On
Make: Gray Folder Letter

Stock Number;__ 4210-1/3GRA
Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery:_As Specjified —

FOLDER LETTER, RED 100/BX 100 BX $
5751000934

17.00

Bidding Qn
Make: Red Folder Letter

Stock Number: -
Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery: Ags Specified
35.00

EOLDER LTR BLUE STRAIGHT TAB 100 BX S
W/FASTENERS, 50/8X
5751001275

Bidding On
Make: Letter Blue Folder w/Fasteners

Stock Number:_ 21301
Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery:_As_S_pecj_f_j_ed
17.00
S

FOLDER LTR GREEN 100/8X 100 BX
5751001273

Bidding Og
Make: Green Folder Letter

Stock Number;_4210-1/3BGR
Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery:_As_Specified

s 1700.00

2500.00

s 1700.00

1700.00
S

3500.00
S

1700.00
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TEM UNIT
NQ. DESCRIPTION ary  uom PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

A
& FOLDER LTR MANILA 100 BX $ 2.00

1/3 CuUT 100/BX
5751000128

Bidding On .
Make: Manila Folder Letter

Stack Number:__ 3784 —
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: _As_Specified

44.1 FOLDER LTR ORANGE STRAIGHT TAB 100 BX S
W/FASTENERS, 100/BX
5751001276

38.00

Bidding On
Make:_Letter Orange Folder w/Fasteners

Stock Number: 12540
Brand; Smead

Date of Delivery:_ As_Specified

45.1 FOLDER LTR PURPLE STRAIGHT TAB 100 BX ]
W/FASTENERS, 100/BX
5751001274

40.00

Bidding On
Make;__Letter Purple folder w/Fasteners

Stock Number: 13040/73034
Brand:__Smead

Date of Delivery:__As_Specified

46.1 FOLDER LTR TEAL 100/BX 100 BX
5751001272

¢ 17.00

Bidding On
Make: Teal Folder Letter

Stock Number: 4210-1/ 3TEA

Brand: Pendaflew

Date of DeliVEFVLAs_Spec.i,ﬁiea

47.1 FOLD LEG MANILA 1/3 cuT 100 BX s

100/BX
$751000131

11.00

Bidding On

Make: Manila Folder Legal

Stock Number:__ 3181

Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery:_ AS Specified

28.00
48.1 FOLD LTR MANILA 1" EXPD POCKET 100 BX $
50/BX
5751000129

Bidding O
n,:ak;': ﬂExpd Pocket Folder manila letter

Stock Number:_ 22100
Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery: As Specified

¢ 200.00

s 3800.00

4000.00
5

¢ 1700.00

1100.00
S

s 2800.00
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ITEM

ary  uom

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

NQ,

DESCRIPTION

49.1 Hl=~LITER, YELLOW

12 EA/DZ
$751001254

Bidding On

Make;_ Highlighter,

200

Yellow

Stock Number:_.

2303 -

Brand: e

Bazic

Date of Delivery: As Specified
- i

\ 50.1 /HI~ LITER, GREEN

.,

51.1

52.1

53.1

54.1

—

12 EA/DZ
5751001255

Bidding On

100

Make: Highlighter, Green

Stock Number:

22304 .

Brand;

Bazigc

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

INK ROLL ON STAMP, BLACK 2 FL 02 5

5751000821

Bidding On
Make: Ink

er, Black

Stock Number:

AVE21 445%,

Brand:

—_Avery (Carter
Date of Delivery:_ As Specified

INK ROLL ON STAMP, BLUE 2 FLOZ

§$751000623

Bidding On
Make;

20

Stock Number:

Brand:

Date of Delivery:

LABELS, END TASB FILING COLOR
CODPED (F) 1 X 1.25, WHITE/RL

5753009842

Bidding On
Make,__ Lab

els (F)

s

50

Stock Number:

67076

Brand: Sme

ad

Date of Delivery:_ As_Specified

LABELS, END TAB FILING COLOR
COPED (M) 1 X 1.25, WHITE/RL

5704501093

Bidding O
— nLabels (M)

Make:

50

Stack Number:

67083

Brand;__ Smead
Dateof Delivery:__ As Specified

DZ

Dz

EA

EA

RL

RL

s 5.00

s 2.80

No Bid

10.00

9.00

s 1000.00

500.00

¢ 14.00

No Bid

500.00

450.00
s __
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ITEM

ary Uom

PRICE
EXTENSION

UNIT
PRICE

NO.

5§5.1

56.1

)

58.1

59.1

60.1

MARKER, WHITEBOARD,
"THICK 6/PK VARIOUS COLORS

DESCRIPTION
EA

LTQ ULTRIUM -4 DATA TAPE MEDIA 200

5704501093

Bidding On
Make:
Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

200 EA

LTO ULTRIUM -6 DATA TAPE MEDIA
5704501094

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number;
Brand:; .
Date of Delivery:

200 DZ

MARKER, CHISEL BLACK
i2Dp2
5751001262

Bidding On
Make:___Marker,

Stock Number:_ 1274
Brand:___ Bazdic /

Date of Delivery: As Specified

MARKER, CHISEL BLUE
12Dz
5751000198

Bidding On
Make: Marker, Blue

Stock Number;_ 1273
Brand:__Bazic

Date of Delivery:_ As Specified
4

MARKER, CHISEL RED
12 bz
5751000189

Black

-

200 Oz

100 Dz

Bidding On
Make: Marker, Red

Stock Number; 1273

Brand:__Bazic
Date of Delivery:_AS _Specified

300 PG

5752001203

Bidding O .
Eigiihhlteboard Marker

Stock Number:_ {259
Brand:___Bazic

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

$ No Biad $ No Bid

$ No Bid $ No Bid

3.00 . '600.00/

600.00
S

3.00 5300.00,

540.0

$1.80 s
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ITEM
NO.

73.1

74.1

76.1

77.1

78.1

DESCRIPTION Qry UgmM

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

PEN, TRANSLUCENT BLUE, 12/D2 200 Dbz
5751001266

Bidding On
Make: Blue Pen

Stock Number: 1756
Brand:__ Bazic

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

PEN, BALL POINT BLUE, 12/D2 200 Dz
§$752001195

Bidding On .
Make:__ Ballpoint Pen Blue

Stock Number; 17005
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery:_As__Sp_e_c_j_ﬁi ed

PENCIL SHARPENER, ELECTRIC
STANDARD SIZE
5752000500

20 EA

Bidding On .
Make:__ Electric Pencil Sharpener

Stock Number;_ EPI-19500
Brand: X-Acto
Date of Delivery:__As Specified

PENCIL, WQOD # 2 AMERICAN, 12/DZ 100 D2
$751000246

Bidding On .

Make: Pencil #2
Stock Number: 763
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

PERFORATOR PAPER, 2 HOLE 100 EA
5752001208

Bidding On
Make: Punch Two-Hole

Stock Number: 9800
Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery:_ As Specified

PORTFOL10 D/PKT BLUE 25/BX 50 EA
5751000589

Bldding On .
Make: Portfolio Folder Blue

Stock Number:_ 27183
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery:__As_Specified

g 2-00

-$‘2.00

28.00

$ 1.20

s 9.50

s 400.00

400.00

560.00

120,00

650.00

s 475.00
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ITEM UNIT PRICE
Qry  uom PRICE EXTENSION

NO. DESCRIPTION
¢ 1.50 $.375.00

79.1 POSTIT FLAGS {PLAIN COLOR) 50/PK 250 PKG
5651500002

Bidding On
Make: Post it Flags

Stock Number:_ 5173
Brand:__ Bazic

Date of Delivery: As Specified ,

80.1 POSTIT FLAGS {SIGN HERE) 50/PK 250 PKG $ 1.50 $375.00
5751001264 E—

Bidding On ' )

Make: Fost it Flags'Sign Here"
Stack Number; 5174
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

81.1 ] POST IT NOTE, 3" X 5, YELLOW, 12/PK 100  PKG $
.~ 5751001100

6.50 . S650.00

Bidding On
mﬁg_Post it Notes
Stock Number:_ SPR19784 .

Brand: Rusiness Sonrce '

Date of Delivery; _As_SPgP;Lf_ied .
¢ 250.00

821 POSTIT NOTE, 3X3 CANARY 100 “PRG g 2.350

100 SHEET, 12/PK
5651500001

Bidding O
Make: — Post it Note 3"x3"

Stock Number:_ 5160
Brand: Bazic
" DateofDelivery,_As Specified
T
83.1 POSTIT NOTE, 2X2, ASSORTED 100 PKG $_12.00 ¢ 1200.00
12/PK
5651500003

Bidding O _
N;ak;r: ® post it note 2"x2"
Stock Number; =BU6

Brand: Early Buy

Date of Belivery:_ As_ Specjified _—

300 EA 5

No Bid No Bid

84.1 RECORD BOOK LEG
W/OUT INDEX S00 PGS
§753000017

Bidding On

Make: : -
Stock Number._
Brand:_

Date of Delivery:__.
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o A
87.1 'RULER TRANSPARENT 12" PLASTIC

ITEM
QiY _UoOm

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

NO. _ DESCRIPTION
85.1 RUBBER BAND #64 50 PKG
1/418/PK

5751000793

Bidding Cn .
.

Make: Rubher Bang

Stock Number:_[INV00464

Brand:__Unjiversal: .
Date of Delivery: As—Speeified

86.1 RUBBER BAND #16 50
1/4 1B/PK,
S751000015

PKG

DY

Bidding On
Make: Rubbher Band

Stock Number: UNV0O047T6
Brand: Universal

Date of Delivery; As Specified

100 EA

\_~" S§752000303

(s

Bidding On
make:__ Ruler Transparent 12"—-r

Stock Number:_ 325
Brand:__Bazic

Date of Delivery:_Ag Speci fied

881 /)RULER TRANSPARENT 18" PLASTIC 100
5752000306

EA

—

Blddlm O
* Ruler 18"

Make:
Stock Number;. ACM-10564

Brand: Westcoot

Date of Delivery:__As Specified
&

89.1 SCISSORS PLASTIC HANDLE 8"
5511000029

Bidding On_

Make:___ Scissors 8"

Stock Number:__ 4441

Brand:__ Bazic

Date of Delivery: _ s Specified

90.1 SIDETABS SELF-STICK, 1X1.25, NUMERIC 100  BX
WHITE, 500/ROLL, 10 ROLLS/BX, 0-9
5753009841

Bidding Cn
Make: -

Stock Number:__ /
Brand:__ . __
Date uf Delivery;_

100 PR

$ 1‘20

s No Bid

s 60.00

60.00

40.00

250.00

&
-

150.00

$ No Bid
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P

ITEM
NQO. __DESCRIPTION

ary

upmM

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

91.1 STACKABLE TRAY SMOKE LETTER
5752000304

Bidding On
Stackable Tray Letter

Make:
stock Number; 21001
Brand:_ OIC

Date of Delivery:__As Specified

52.1 STAMP PAD BLUE SMALL 4X6
5751001240

M&Qg
Make: tamp Pad Blue

Stock Number:_ 4100-EE3

Brand:__Genmes e
Date of Delivery;_AS Specified

53.1 STAMP PAD RED SMALL 4X6
5751001241

Bidding On

" Make: tamp Pad Red
Stock Number;__ 4 TO0-ABRA
Brand: _Genmes

Date of Delivery.__As Sgggi fied

94.1 STAMPER INK REFILL
10 CC/BT, RED
5751000816

id o]
Sding On ped inker refill,

Make;
Stock Number:___ 290073

Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery:_ As Specified

95.1 STAMPER RUBBER "DRAFT* ,
5752001128

Bidding On
Make: Stamp"Draft"

50

S0

50

50

24ml

50

Stock Number:_ SPR60017 / 12001

Brand:__Sparco Genmes

i Dateof Delivery:_ As Specified

s :
[ 96.1 \-STAPLE REMIOVER W/HANDLE
-7 5752001194

Bidding On
Make: Staple Remover

Stock Number: 5092
Brand:__Genmes

Dateof Delivery:_ As Specifijed

100

EA

EA

EA

BT

EA

EA

$ 3.00

3.50

s 1.50

5 150.00

90.00

80.00

25.00

175.00
S

s 150.00
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UNIT PRICE

ITEM
NO. _DESCRIPTION ary __uom PRICE EXTENSION
(-" 103 1 TAPE TRANSPARENT 3/4 x 36 YDS 100 RL $1.00 $__100.00

S CLEJQR Ref: Stotch Magic (or equal)
$751001238
Bidding On i
Make: Transparent Tape _
Stock Number;_. 90? . -
Brand:____~ ' Bazic
Date of Delivery;_ AS Specified

104.1 TAPE FILAMENT 1-1/2 X60YDS . 50 R $15.00 $_750.00

$751000322

Biddipg On _ . )
Maker" Filament Tape 1.5"
Stock Number:  None

Brand

‘___Business Source
Date of Delivery:__As Specjfied

105.1 TAPE FILAMENT 1" X 60 YDS 100 RL
5751000319 '

§8.50 - 4 850.00

Bidding O
Makerzl ® Filament Tape 1"
Stock Number: BEN64017 ,

Braﬂdr_.Busineag_s_o_u_E
Date of Delivery;_ AS peCJ. ied E

SN
105 1 TAPE MASKING 1-1/2 X 60 YDS 100 RL $_1.60 $ 160.00

234 High Temp.
5751000347

Bidding On

Make: Masking Tape

Stock Number:__ 953

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery:__ AS Specified

9.00 s 900.00

107.1 TAPE TRANSPARENT 600 1”X72 CLEAR 100 RL s
$751000353

Bidding On
Make: Transparent Tape

Stock Number;  MMM600-72-3PK
Brand: 3M

Date of Delivery:_As_Specified

108.1 COPIER PAPER (B.5" x 11") 43,000 REAMS
(216 X 279mm); 5005HT/20 18,
10 REAMS/CASE
5753000808

—_—

$ No Bid $ No Bid

Bidding Cn
BRAND/MAKE:

PLACE OF ORIGIN:
STOCK NO./REORDER NO:
DATE OF DELIVERY: ‘
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SPECIAL PROVISIONS

OFFICE SUPPLIES

This is an “Indefinite Quantity Bid” pursuant to Section 3119(1)(2) of the 2 GAR

Procurement Regulations. The quantities reflected are annual estimated requirements
projected within a twelve (12) month period. These amounts may increase during the
term of this bid. FHowever, regardless of the fluctuation of quantities, this bid shall be

subject to the availability of funds.

Delivery:
60 Days Upon Receipt of a Purchase Order. Delivery schedule time and quantity will

be coordinated between the successful bidder and the requesting department on an as
needed basis.

Contract Period:
The term of this contract is for a period of one (1) year on an as needed basis dependent

upon the availability of funds.

Additional Requirement;

In the event that other agencies within the Government of Guam, having the same
requirements, upon notifications and acceptance of the additional requirements, the
effective price of said bid, shall be used as a confirm price. This additional requirement

shall not exceed the term of this bid.
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