INVITATION FOR BID

ISSUING OFFICE:
: GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY
%, / GOVERNMENT OF GUAM
2 o b WV Tufe 148 ROUTE 1, MARINE DRIVE
CLAUDIA S. ACFALLE PITI, GUAM 96915

Chief Procurement Officer

DATE ISSUED: September 14. 2020 BID INVITATION NO: GSA-046-20

BiD FOR OFFICE SUPPLIES
SPECIFICATION: SEE ATTACHED

DESTINATION: GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY {DOA)

REQUIRED DELIVERY DATE: 60 Days Upon Reccipt of Purchase Order, For a period of One (1} year an
an as needed basis upon availability of funds. This is on indefinite guantity bid.

INSTRUCTION TO BIDDERS:
X

INDICATE WHETHER: INDIVIDUAL PARTNERSHIP CORPORATION

INCORPORATED IN; _ Guam

This bid shall be submited in duplicaie and scaked to the issaing affice above oo liter than (Time) 9:00 AM. Date: 9/29/20 and shall be publicly
opened.  Bid submitied after the time and date epeciffed above shall be rejecied,  See atsoched General Terms and Coaditions, and Scaled Bid

Solicitation for details.

The undersipned offers and ogrees 1o fumish within the time specificd, the orticles and services at the price sioied opposite the respective ilems listed an
the schedule provided, unless otherwise specificd by the bidder  In consideralion 1o the expense of the Government in opening, whuliring, and
evaluating this and other hids, und other considerstions, the undersigned agrees that this bid wmain finn and irevoeable within 30 calendae days from

Ihe date opening (o supply ony or all the iterns which prices ore quoted.

NAME AND ADDRESS OF BIDDER: SIGNATURE ANB-FITLE OF PERSON
Richard Luo AUTHORIZED TO SIGN THIS BID:

979 Army Dr. PMB 108 resident

Barrigada, Guam 96913

AWARD: CONTRACT NO.: G5A-046-20 AMOUNTETIS649.50 paTE:

ITEM NO(S). A p:1.1, 2.1, 14,1 thru 18.1, 21,1, 30.7, 3&.1 thru
B theu 50,7, 0301, 861, STo1, SaoT o Stets 58,1591, 6tot e
0.1, B4.1 thru 86.1, 90.1 thry 95.1, 99.1, 101.1, 102.1°& 107.1

CTING OFFICER:
v VA Vo Hufu

CLAUDIA S. ACFALLE
Chief Procurement Oficer

NAME AND ADDRESS OF CONTRACTOR: SIGNATURE AND TITLE OF PERSON
AUTHORIZED TO SIGN THIS CONTRALT:

P — il LYY

Barrigada, Guam 96913
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ITEM

UNIT

Qry__UoM PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

NO. _ DESCRIPTION

s
@ \ BATTERY, AA ENERG ALKAL, 2/rG 200 PG

$613500883

“—"g""::,::ie': Dan Battery
Stock Number;_ 22384
Brand:___Energizer

. Dateofpelivery:__As Specified

éf. .- BATTERY, AAA ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG_ 200 PG
$613500814

Bidding On -
Make:  AAA Battery
Stock Number:_ 33640

Brand: Enerqgizer

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

3.1 BATTERY, C ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG 100 PG
5613500884

Bidding On
Make: C Battery

Stack Number:__ 220259 .

Brand: Nuracell

Date of Delivery:__p o Specified
Ed

41  BATTERY, D ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG 00 PG
5613500003

ro

Bidding On
Make: = D Battery

Stock Number: 220258
Brand:____Duracell

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

5.1 BiNDER VIEW 2" WHITE 100 EA

s 1.90

5.50

5.50

5751001196 —_—

Bidding On __. .

Make: View Binder 2" White
Stock Number___ 3151
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery:__As_Specified

6.1 BINDER VIEW 1-1/2" BLACK 00 EA
5751001200

Bidding On
Make: View Binder 1.5" Black

Stock Number:__ 3147
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: a5 Specified

2.80

1.90

3.50

s 3B0.00

380.00

550,00
s

550.00

s 350.00

280.00
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ITEM -
NO. _ DESCRIPTION Qry ___uom

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

13.1 CLIP STANDARD # 1, 100/Bx 200 BX
5751000052

iddin,

Make: Paper Clip #1

Stock Number:, 990631
Brand:_Genmesg ..
Date of Delivery: _Ag Snecified

@ CLIP, PBL MINI COLOR ASSORTED 200 BX

/ 24f8X
5751001250

Bidding O .
Make: Paper Clip Color Mini

Stack Number;__31024
Brand: NIC

Date of Delivery: _As Specified

15.1 ) CLIP, DBL, 1-1/2" X 5x8 200 BX
ASSORTED COLOR MED, 12/BX
5751001249

Bidding Ont
Make: Paper Clip Color Medium

Stock Number;___ 31029
Brand: Q1C
Date of Defivery:__AS Specified

. 16?!) CLIP, DBL, 12" X 3x8 200 BX
" ASSORTED COLOR SM, 12/8X
5751001248

Bidding On
Make: Paper Clip Color Small

Stock Number;___ 31028
Brand: QIC

Date of Delivery:__ As Specified

T 173 } CLIP, DBL 1/4" MIN! BLACK 200 BX
Tt 12/5)(,
5751001193

Bidding On
Make: Paper Clip Black Black

Stock Number;__ 000801
Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery: As Specified

181 ' CLIP, DBL 2" 200 BX
. .~ ASSORTED COLORLG. 12/BX —_—
§751001251

Bidding On
Make: Paper Clip Color Large

Stock Number:__ 65363
Brand; Business Source
pate of Delivery;_ As Specified

¢ 0.80

s 4-00

s =.00

s 3.50

0.50

¢ 6.00

$ 160.00

5800.00

¢ 1000.00

g 700.00

100.00
s

$ 1200.00
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-

Make: #10 Envelopes Plain White

Stock Mumber: 11118
@rand: Quality Park

Date of Delivery:_AS Specified

ITEM UNIT PRICE
NO. DESCRIPTION ary _ uUoM PRICE EXTENSION
19.1 CLIPBOARD LEGAL 5IZE; WOOD 20 EA $ 2.50 s 50.00
5752000004
Bidding Cn .
Make:  Clipboard Legal
Stock Number:__1804
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: As Specified
2.00 .
20.2  CUPBOARD LETTER SIZE WOOD 20 EA $ ] 40.00
5751000006 -
Bidding On
Make: Clipboard Letter
Stock Number:, 18 E]
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: AS Specified
{211 /DIsc, D BLANK 500 EA s 0.30 $_150.00
-~ 5583500595
Bidding On
Make: CD-R
stack Number;___¢ 7930
Brand: Verbatim
Date of Delivery;_AS Specified
22,1 DISPENSER, TAPE 1-1/2 500 MODEL 20 EA s 10.00 52 00.00
5752000060
Bidding On .
Make: Tape Dispenser Large 3" Core
Stock Number; 3300
Brand: Genmes
Date of Delivery:_As Specified
23.1 DISPENSER, TAPE UP FQ 1" 3M 20 EA $ 2.50 $ 50.00
C-25
5752000433
Blidding On . .
Mak: Tape Dispenser Medium 1" Core
Stack Number___>=>1U
Brand: Genmesg
Date of Delivery:_As Specified
48 .00 4800.00
24.1 ENVELOPE WHITE # 10 100 BX $ S
SELF SEAL PLAIN 500/BX -
5753000811
Bidding On
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ITEM
NO.

251

26.1

27.1

28.1

29.1

N
30.1\’

UNIT

DESCRIPTION oty uom PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

ENVELOPE WINDOW H 10 100 BX ¢ _47.00

SELF SEAL WINDOW WHITE 500/8%
$753000810

Ridding On
Make: - :#10 Envelopes,Window

stock Number:_ 521378
Brand: = "@ual ftyPark

Date of Delivery: As Speacified -

50 BX $

ENVELOPE 9X12 42.00
OPEN/KRAFT 250/BX CAT.
§753000087

Bidding On
Make: Catalog Envelopes, Kraft

Stock Number:__ 41460

Brand:____Quality Park
Date of Delivery:__As Speci fied

ENVEL 10"X13”INTER-DEPT./MESS 50 BX

100/BX
5753009839

s 39.00

Bidding On .
Make:  Inter-Office Envelopes, Kraft

Stock Number:_ 63561 L
8rand: Quality Park
Date of Delivery:__As Specified

ENVELOPE CLASP 7X10 KRAFT 50  BX
100/8X
5753000698

28.00
s

Bidding On
Make: Clasp Envelope

Stock Number;__ 37868
Brand: Quality Park

Date of Delivery: As _Specified

ERASER, WHITEBOARD 5" 20 EA $
5751001259

Bidding On .
Make: Whiteboard Eraser

Stock Number_ 2229
Brand; Bazic

bate of Delivery:_As Specified

FASTENER W/BASE 2", 50/BX 200 BX ]
§751000136

Bidding On
Make: Fasteners

Stock Number:___ 7017
Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery:_Ag Specified

$.4700.00

2100.0
. $ 0

s 1950.00

1400.00
S

50.00

s 600.00
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UNIT

ITEM
PRICE

NG. BESCRIPTION Qry  uUomM

PRICE
EXTENSION

31.1 FLASH DRIVE 16GB 200 EA. 520_

§752001200

BddinzOn p1ash Drive 16GB
Stock Number:__None
Brand:

____ Kingston
Date of Dellvery:_As Specified

32.1 FLASH DRIVE 8GB
$75200119%

100 EA, s

Bidding On
Make: Flash Drive 8 GB

Stack Number:__None
8rand: Kingston

Date of Delivery; —As Specified
14.50

33.1 FLASH DRIVE 32GB 200 EA. 5
$75200120t

Bidding On
Make: Flash Drive 32 GB

Stock Number:__None
Brand: Kingston
Dateof Delivery: A5 Specified

/"".-—\\
J 34.1 ! FOLDER LETTER PRESBRD 100 BX $ 39.00

.- 2 DIV/6 SEC BRK-RED/10 BX
S751001268

Bldding On
Make: Classification Folder

Stock Number:__ 1257R
grand: Pendaflex
Date of Delivery:_ As Specified

' 35.% FOLDER MANILA LEGAL GRAY 100/BX 100 BX
5$751001127

$ 28.00
- .

Bidding On Legal Gray Folder

Make:
StockNumber: 153-1/3GRA ———

Brand: Pendaflex
... DateofDelivery:_As Specified
o1 15.00
361 FOLDER LEG MANILA 100 BX $
. 7 1/5CUT 100/BX
—7 5751000127

Bidding &
ﬁ;ﬁ?‘ﬂ Manila Folder Legal

Stock Number:_753-1/5

Brand:_Pendaflex
Date of Delivery:_ps Specified

1900.
s 00.00

s 800.00

s 2900.00

3900.00

¢ 2800.00

s 1500.00
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ITEM

NO. ory  uom

DESCRIPTION

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

FOLDER MANILA LTR BLUE 00 68X

100/BX
5751000535

371

Biddi n
Make:
Stack Number;

4210-1/3BT.0I
Brand: Pendaflex = _
Date of Delivery;__AS Specified

6;_1\ FOLDER LTR GOLDENROD 106/BX
__/ 5751000933

Bidding On -

Make: Goldenrod Folder Letter
Stock Number;_12234

Brand: Smead

Date of Delivery:_ As _Sperified
-
VOV
[ 39.1 K FOLDER MANILA LTR GRAY
k,/’ 100/8X
§751000936

Blue Folder Letter

100 BX s

100 BX $

Bidding On _
Make: Gray Folder Letter

Stock Number.__4210-1/3GRA
Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

wf FOLDER LETTER, RED 100/BX

100 BX s
§751000934

Bldding On

Make: Red Folder Letter

Stock Number; = D

Brand: Pendafle

Date of Dellvery._Ag Specified

41.1 FOLDER LTR BLUE STRAIGHT TAB
W/FASTENERS, 50/BX
5751001275

00 BX

Bidding On
Make: Letter Blue Folder w/Fasteners

Stock Number;___ 21301

Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery:_As Specified
e

{ 421 ' FOLOER LTR GREEN 100/BX
N~ 5751001273

100 BX $

Bidding On
Make: Green Folder Letter

Stack Number: 42710-1/3BGR
Brand;: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery:_As Specified

¢ 22.50

29.00

22.50

22.50

3 45.00

22.50

s 2250.00

2900.00
s

$ 2250.00

s 2250.,00

s 4500.00

$ 2250.00
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ITEM

UNIT
DESCRIPTION orY UOM PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

NO.

43.1

45.1

46.1

47.1

48.1

S

FOLDER LTR MANILA 00 BX 51250
1/3 CUT 100/6X
5751000128

Bidding On
Make: Manila Folder Letter

Stock Number:__3184 —_
Brandi__Bazic

Date of Defivery:_As Specified

FOLDER LTR ORANGE STRAIGHT TAB 100 BX
W/FASTENERS, 100/BX
5751001276

$ 45.00

Bidding On
make: Letter Orange Folder w/Fasteners

Stock Number:__ 12540
Brand: Smead

Date of Delivery:__As_Specified

FOLDER LTR PURPLE STRAIGHT TAB i00 BX
W/FASTENERS, 100/8X
5751001274

49,00
L

:;z_g_r‘L:;n 0 etter Purple Folder wfFasteners
Stock Number:  13040/13034

Brand:__ Smead

Date of Delivery:__AS Specified

FOLDER LTR TEAL 100/BX 100 BX

s 22.50

" §751001272

Bidding On
Make; Teal Folder Letter

Stock Number;_ 4210-1/3TEA

Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery: As_Specified

FOLD LEG MANILA 1/3 cuT 00 BX s
100/8X
5751000131

14,50

Bidding On

Make: Manila Folder Legal
Stock Number:__3181

Brand: Razic

Date of Delivery:_ AS Specifijied

FOLD LTR MARNILA 1" EXPD POCKET 100 BX ]

50/8X
5751000129

38.00

Bidding O
N;ak: nExpd Packet Folder manila letter

Stock Number:__ 22100
Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery:_ As Specified

s 1250.00

¢ 4500,00

4900.00
S

3 2250.00

s 1450.00

$ 3800.00
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Bidding O
dﬂz "rabels (M)
Stock Number:_67083

Brand: Smead

Date of Delivery:_ s Specified

ITEM UNIT PRICE
NO. __ DESCRIPTION QTY UOM PRICE EXTENSION
49,1  HI- UTER, YELLOW 200 DZ $9.50 $.1900.00
12 EA/DZ
5751001254
Bidding On
Make: Highlighter, Yellow
Stock Number; AVE24000
Brand:__Hi-liter
Date of Delivery:_As Specified
i
9.50 .
50.1 WHI-UTER, GREEN 00 bz 5 $ 250.00
12 EA/DZ
5751001255
i i 0 0 I3
Make: Highlighter, Green
Stock Number: AVE24020
Brand:__ Hi-Liter
Date of Delivery: 25 Specified
e
! 51,1 ~INKROLLON STAMP, BLACK 2 FL 0Z 5 EA $5.50 $_27.50
. 5751000821
R P —
Bldding On
Make: Inker, Black
Stock Number:_ AVE21448
Brandi___ Ave ry Carter
Date of Delivery:_As Specified
No Bid No Bid
52,1 I[INKROLLON STAMP, BLUE2 FLOZ 20 EA s L]
5751000623
" Bidding On
Make:
Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:
s 13.50 675.00
{ 53,1 LABELS, END TAB FILING COLOR 50 RL 0§ . ; :
-~ CODED (F)1X 1.25, WHITE/RL
i 57530009842 —_—
Bidding On
Make: Labels (F)
Stock Number_ 67076
Brand: Smead
- Date of Delivery:. As Specified
(N 13.50 675.00
\ s4y LABELS, END TAB FILING COLOR 50 RL§ $
.~ CODED (M) 1 X 1.25, WHITE/RL
§704501053
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.

N
N\,

ITEM
NQ.

55.1

56.1

57.2

58.1

._\‘
59.1/
~

60.1

} MARKER, CHISEL BLUE 200 D2 [ $

UNIT PRICE

DESCRIPTION aTY__ uoM PRICE EXTENSION
LTO ULTRIUM -4 DATA FAPE MEDIA 200 ea $30.00 ¢ 6000.00
5704501093 — ‘

BiddIng On

Make: IBM LTO Ultrium 4
Stock Number:__None

Brand; I1BM

Date of Delivery;__AS Specified

LTO ULTRIUM -6 DATA TAPE MEDIA 200 EA
5704501094

545'00 ¢ 9000.00

Bidding O
HCEEDN rEM LTO Ultrium 6

Make:
Stock Number;__ 1V One

Brand; IBM
Date of Delivery,__As Specified
7.50 1500.00

MARKER, CHISEL BLACK 200 D2 ] s

1202 E—
5751001262

Bidding On
Make:___Marker, Black

Stock Number;__ 1274
Brand: __Bazit

Date of Delivery: Bg Specified

7.50 1500.00

1202
5751000198

Bidding On
make: Marker, Blue

Stock Number: 1273
Brand:___Bazig¢

Date of Delivery: _As Specified
— 7.50 s 750.00

MARKER, CHISEL RED o0 D2 $

1202
§751000159

Bidding On
mMake: Marker, Red

Stock Number:___ 1273
Brand:___Bazic

Date of Delivery:_AS Specified

MARKER, WHITEBOARD, 300 FG [
THICK 6/PK VARIQUS COLORS
5752001203

Bidding On ., .
Whlteboard Marker

Stack Number:_1 259
Brand:___Bazic

Date of Delivery:_Ag Specified

2.90 870.00
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LNIT PRICE

ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION ary —dom PRICE EXTENSION

611 ' MECH. LEAD PENCIL .5MM EACH 50 EA ¢ 0.80 ¢ 40.00

5751000247

Bidding On . .
Make:_ Mechanical Pencil 0.5mm

Stack Number:_ 720
Brand.__ Bazic

. DateofDelvery:_As Specified
™ 0.80 40.00

i\sz.1‘.'5 MECH. LEAD PENCIL .7MM EACH 50 EA $
S 7 §751001269 -

Bidding On )
Make: Mechical Pencil §.7mm

Stock Number;_ /25
Brand:___Bazic

Date of Dellvery:_ As Specifjed
4.50 1350.00

, 63.1\/ MOISTENER SORTKWIK {LARGE) 300 EA S : s
S 5752001202

Bidding On .
Make;_Finger Moistener

Stock Number: LEE-10132
Brand: Sortkwik ’

Date of Delivery:_a g Specified S .
/ ¢ 150.00

— .
/e 64.1 | PAD RULED LTR 5”%8" CANARY 20 PG $
12 PDS/PG
$75300C474

Bidding On

Make: Pad Ruled 5"xB"
Stock Number:_ 20-264
Brand: Amnpad

Date of Delivery: As Specified
—

(asD PAD RULED LEG CANARY ) 0 PG $_15.50 5
.~ 12 POSfPG
$753000241 -

775.00

pRe

Bidding On
Make: Pad Ruled Legal

Stock Number:__ 2(1_263
Brand: Ampad

. DateofDelivery: s Specified

.
7N
{ §61] PADRULED LEG WHITE - 50 PG
12 POS/PG
5753000244

15.50 . 775.00

%:-5‘5'% Pad Ruled Legal

Stock Number:_ 20.-363 -
8rand: Ampad
Date of Delivery:__ &S Specified
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DESCRIPTION ary_ uom

uNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

70.2

721

PAD RULED LTR WHITE 10 PG

12 PDS/PG
$753000243

Bldding On
Make: Pad Ruled Letter

Stock Number:__ 5039
grand:___Bazic

Date of Delivery:_ AS Specified

PAD RULED 5"X8" WHITE 50 PG
12 PDS/PG
5753000885

Bidding On
Make:__Pad Ruled 5'"x8"
Stock Number:_20~384

Brand:__Amnpad,
Date of Delivery:_As Specified

+ PAD STEND 6”Xg” 100 PG
" BOSHT/PD, 12PD/PG

§753000285

Bidding On
Make:_ Pad Steno 6"x9" 3t

Stock Number: 25274 /
Brand:___Ampad

Date of Delivery;_ As Specified

PAPERCOPY 8 %4 X 11 BLUE 50 RM

10 RMS/CS
5753000844

Bldding On

Make; Copy Paper Letter Blue
Stock Number:_ MP-~2201-BE

Brand:___Bojise or Bazic
Date of Defivery:_ As Specified

PEN, MECH. LEAD .5MM
TUBE/REFILLS
5751000443

20 TUBE

Bidding On
make: Mechanical Pencil Lead

Stock Number:___782
Brand;__Bazic

Date of Delivery:__As Specified

PEN, TRANSLUCENT BLACK, 12/D2 200 D2
5751001267

Bidding On

Make: Black Pen

Stock Numberi___1755
Brand:__ Bazic

Date of Delivery:_ Ag Specified

¢ 11.00

25.00

$_10.50

¢ 0-60

$1100.00

375.00

2500.00
s 50

$ 525,00

s 12.00

s 900.00
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ITEM

UNIT

aQry  uoM PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

NO.

731
74.1

75.1

76.1

(72)

78.1

DESCRIPTION

PERN, TRANSLUCENT BLUE, 12/DZ 200 Dz s 4.50

5751001266

Bidding On
Make: Blue Pen

Stock Number:_ 1756
grand:___ Bazic

Date of Delivery:_AS Specified

PEN, BALL POINT 8LUE, 12/DZ ) 00 DZ
$752001195

s 4.50

Bidding On ‘
Make;___Ballpoint Pen Blue

Stock Number;_ 1 7005
grand:___ Bazic

Dateof Delivery:_As Specified

PENCIEL SHARPENER, ELECTRIC 20 EA-
STANDARD SIZE
5752000500

4 35.00

Bidding On )
Make:_Electric Pencil Sharpener

Stack Number;_ EFI-T9500
Brand:___ X~Acto
Date of Delivery:_As Specified

PENCIL, WOOD # 2 AMERICAN, 12/D0Z 100 DZ S
5751000246

-
by

1.70

Bidding On .

Mak:z: Pencil #2
Stock Number;__ 763
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery:_As_ Specified

PERFQRATOR PAPER, 2 HOLE 100 €A $
§752001208 ’

9.50

Bidding On
Make; Punch Two-Hole

Stock Number:_ 9800
Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery:__As_Specified
12.50

PORTFOLIO D/PKT BLUE 25/BX 50 EA S
$751000589

Bidding On
make; Portfolio Folder Blue

Stock Number:__ 2183
Brand: Bazic

Date of Defivery:_Ag Specified

5_900.00

¢ 900.00

¢ 700.00

170,00

¢ 950.090

s 625.00
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80.1 POSYIT FLAGS {SIGN HERE} 50/PK ) 250 PKG
5751001264

ITEM
a1y UoMm

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

NG.  DESCRIETION

79.1 )POST IT FLAGS (PLAIN COLOR)} 50/PK 250 PKG
5651500002

Bidding On .
Make;__ Post it Flags

Stock Number;_ 5173
8rand:___ Razic

. Date of Delivery: As Sperified

Bldding On :
Make: Fost it Flags"Sign Herse"

Stock Number;_ 5174
Brand: Bazic

Date of Defivery:_ As_Specified

81.1 POSTIT NOTE, 3" X 5", YELLOW, 12/PK 100 PKG
5751001100

Bidding Gn
Make: POSt it Notes

Stock Number:__SPR]1 9784
Brand: Business Sonrc

Date of Delivery:_hs__spe_?i_ﬁed

82.1 POST IT NOTE, 3X3 CANARY 100 “PRG
100 SHEET, 12/PK
5651500001

2

Bidding O :
Mak:: ! post it Note 3"x3"
Stock Number:__ 5160
Brand: Razic

Date of Delivery.__As Specified

831 POST [T NOTE, 2X2, ASSORTED . 100 PKG
12/PK
5651500003

Bidding O
"B post it note 2"x2"

Make:
Stack Number;__ =BU0 .

Brand: Early Buy

Date of Delivery:_As Specified _

84.1 | RECORD BOOK LEG 300 EA
/ W/OUT INDEX 500 PGS

.

N §753000017

Bidding On
mg— Record Book Legal -

Stock Number:_9-500-R
Brand:____ Oxford _
Date of Delivery:_As Specified

$ 2.50

s 11.50 .

¢ 7.50

18.00

69.5
, 69.50

s 625.00

625,
s 00

¢ 1150.00

¢ 750.00

s1800.00

¢ 20850.00
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ITEM
NO,

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

o

(""'55.1
. * 1/81B/BK

.

DESCRIPTION Qry _UOMm

RUBBER BAND #64 50 PKG

5751000793

Bidding On
Make:___Rubher Rand

Stock Number:_1INV00 464
Brand:_ gniversal

Date of Delivery: As—& ified

."456.1 \RUBBER BAND #16 50 PKG

-

87.1

88.1

1/4 LB/PK,
$751000015

Bidding On
make: Rubber Band

Stock Number;__UNV00476
8rand: Universal

Date of Delivery; AS _Specified

RULER TRANSPARENT 12" PLASTIC 100 EA
5752000303

Bidding On
make: Ruler Transparent 12" —

Stock Number:_325
Brand:___Bazic

Date of Defivery: As Specified

RULER TRANSPARENT 18" PLASTIC 100 Ea
$752000306

Bldging On
ake: Ruler 18"

Stock Number;_ ACM-10564
Brand: Westcoot

Date of Delivery:_ As Specifjed

SCISSORS PLASTIC HANDLE 8™ 100 PR
£511000029

Bidding On

Make: Scissors 8"

Stock Mumber:__ 4441
Brand:__Bazic

Date of Delivery:__As Specified

SIDETABS SELF-STICK, 1 X 1.25, NUMERIC 100 BX

" WHITE, 560/ROLL, 10 ROLLS/BX, 0-9

5753009841 :

fidding O . .
F‘(;L-%umerlc Side tabs

Stack Number;_ 67370-67379
Brand:___Smead _

Date of Delivery:_ As Specified

s 1.60

$ 115.00

$ 80.00

80.00

90.00
5

750.00
%

250.00
L

¢ 11500.00
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" 851

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

QT UOM

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

NQ.

81.1°, STACKABLE YRAY SMOKE LETTER
'/ $752000304

.

i

. -
et

Bidding On

50

Make; Stackable Tray Letter

stock Numbar;_ 21 00T
Brand;_ OIC

Date of Delivery: _As Specified

92,1 : STAMP PAD BLUE SMALL 4X6

5751001240

Mﬂ%
Make: tamp Pad Blue
Stock Number:_ 41 00-FE3

Brand:__Genmes

Date of Delivery; A8 Specified

93.1 K STAMP PAD RED SMALL aX6
) /) §751001241

Bidding On

Make: otamp Pad Red
Stock Number: 41 00-AAA
Brand:___Genmes

Date of Delivery:__As Specified

Y
94.1) STAMPER INK REFILL

L
.

BN

10 CC/BT, RED
$751000816

Bidding O
vaker Ink Refill Red,

Stock Number;__ 290073
Brond: Genmes

Dateof Dellvery: _As Specified

\
STAMPER RUBBER “DRAFT”

.. /s752001128

96.1

Bidding On
Make: Stamp"Draft"

Stock Number:_ SPR60017
Brand:__Sparco

Date of Delivery:__AS Specified

STAPLE REMOVER W/HANDLE
5752001194

Bidding On
Make: Staple Remover

Stock Number: 5092
Brand:__Genmes

Date of Delivery:_As_Specified

50

S0

50

24ml

5C

100

EA

EA

EA

BT

EA

$

2.90

4.50

7.50

225,00

$

175.00
S

175.00
S

75.00
S

P 375.00

2920.00
$
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ITEM
NO. _ DESCRIPTION

Qry uoMm

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

97.1 STAPLER DESK 6-1/2
310D/550 BLACK STANDARD

5752000316

Bidding On
Make: Stapler Standardg

Stock Number: 5726
Brand:___Genmes

Date of Delivery:_ As Specified

98.1 STAPLES STANDARD SiZE

5000/BX
$752000275

Bidding On
Make: taples Standard

Stock Number;_26 6K
Brand:__ Genmes
Date of Delivery:_p o - Specified

f'\ss.i_ TAPE CALCULATOR 2-1/4"
~ " 5753000058

.

Bidding On
Make: Calculator Tape

Stock Number;_48677
Brand:___EM Company

Date of Delivery;:_AS Specified

100.1 TAPE CORRECTION 5MM X 6M 2WAY
5751001252

Bidding On )
Make: Correction Tape

Stock Number;_68620
Brand:___Tombow

Date of Delivery:_As Spegified

- -
g
'\_101.1) \TAPE MASKING 2" X 60 YD5 3M
234 High Temp.
5751000348

8idding O
o~ nMasking Tape

Make:
Stack Number; MMM -y

Brand; 3M .
Date of Delivery,_ As Specified

102.1 JTAPE TRANSPARENT 600 1/2 X 36
CLEAR

5751000523

Bidding On

Make: Transparent Tape
Stock Number: MMMBSOT0T2T1296
Brand:__ Highland
Date of Delivery:_ As Specified

100 EA

08¢ BX

250 EA

500 EA

160 RL

50 AL

s 9.50

1.60

1.20

0.80

¢ 950.00

120.00

$ 200.00

1750.00
S

¢ 380.00

80.00
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ITEM

NO. DOESCRIPTION qQry _ uom

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

103.1 TAPE;['RANSFARENT 3/4x 36 YDS 100
CLEAR; Ref: Scotch Magic (or equal)
5751001239 .

Bidding On
Make: Transparent Tape

Stock Number:  MMM5910341296
Brand:___ Highland
Date of Delivery:__AS Specified

104.1 TAPE FILAMENT 1-1/2 X 60 YDS 50
$751000322

Bidding 0
;Eﬁ?LﬁFilament Tape 1.5"

Stock Number:__None
Brand: Business Source
Date of Delivery,__As _Specified

105.1 TAPE FILAMENT 1" X 60 YDS 100
$751000319

Bldding O
EEﬁ?‘nFilament Tape 1"

Stock Number;_ BSN64017
BraM:_Husines.g_s.qui.ce
Date of Defivery;__AS Specilfied

106.1 TAPE MASKING 1-1/2 X 60 YDS 100
2324 High Temp.
5751000347

ﬂgmmgﬂMasking Tape

Make:
Stock Number; MMMZ2600772
Brand: 3M/Highland
Date of Defivery: _ As Specified
. f‘-\\
Qﬂ?.l TAPE TRANSPARENT 600 1“X72 CLEAR 100

5751000353

Bidding On
Make: Transparent Tape

Stock Number:_ MMM600-72-3PK
Brand: 3M
Date of Delivery:_ As Specified

RL

RL

RL

RL

RL

108.1 COFIER PAPER {B.5" x 11") 43,000 REAMS

(216 X 278mm); 500SHT/20LB.
10 REAMS/CASE
5753000809

Bldding On

BRAND/MAKE:
PLACE OF ORIGIN:

STOCK NO./REORDER NO:

DATE OF DELIVERY:

1.50

18.00
LI

10.50

4.00

11.00

$ No Bid

5150.00

900.00
.

g 1050.00

400.00
S

1100.00
S

$ No Bid
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