INVITATION FOR BID

ISSUING OFFICE:
GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY
9, GOVERNMENT OF GUAM
2 R N VSN £ /w 148 ROUTE |, MARINE DRIVE
CLAUDIA §. ACFALLE - PITI, GUAM 96915

Chief Procurcment Officer

DATE ISSUED: September 14, 2020 BID INVITATION NO: GSA-046-20
BID FOR OFFICE SUPPLIES

SPECIFICATION: SEE ATTACHED

DESTINATION: GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY (DOAY

REQUIRED DELIVERY DATE: 60 Days Upon Receipt of Purchase Order. For a period of One (1) yenr on
an as needed basis upon availability of funds. This is an indefinite quantity hid.

INDICATE WHETHER.: INDIVIDUAL PARTNERSHIP \/ CORPORAFION

INCORPORATED IN: Guam, USA

This bid shell he submittod in duplicate and sealed to (e issuing office above nn fater than (Time) 9:00 AM, Ouare: 9/29/20 and shall be pubbely
opened. Bt subnrtred wfier the time and date speitied nbose shal be rejecnad. Sce attached General Terors and Conditions, and Scibed Bid

Salivitation far detalls.

The yndersigned offers and sgrees 1 fumish within the time specificd, the articles and services at the price ststed oppasire the respective items lisied on
the schedule provided. unles sthensise specificd hy the bidder,  In consideration o the expease of the Covernment in opening. txbulating, and
evaluuzing this and ather bids, o ether considecations, the wndersipned agrees that this bid 1omain firm any ey ocable witkin 90 calondar deys froin
the date apening to supply any or all the itams whick prices ure quoted,

E AND ADDRESS (0f BIDDER: SIGNATURE ANB-HTLE OF PERSON
anano ¥ome Limded Datully AUTHURIZED TQ SIGN THIS BID-
dba MD WHOLESALE L
442 Chatan San Anomg IGeaneral Manager
Tamuning Guam 86813 |
AWARD: CONTRACT NO.:_GSA-086-20 AnOUNT36,325.00  pate:
ITEM NO(S). AWARDED: 5.1, 7.1 thru 12.1, 19.1, 20.1, 29.1, 47.3, 49.

(11 10 [ 0 L1 B

70.1, 72.1, 73.1, 7.1, 7671, 78.1,

i

CTING OFFICER:
(2w S e [

/ CLAUDIA 5. ACFALLE
Chicf Procurement Officer

NAME AND ADDRESS OF CONTRACTOR: SIGNATLRE AND TITLE OF PERSON
AUTHDRIZED TO SIGN THIS CONTRACT:
M.D, WHOLESALE
442 CHALAN SAN ANTONIO /General Manager

_TAMUNING, GUAM 96321
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iTEM
NG,

DESCRIPTION

Qry ___uom

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

11

2.1

3.1

4.1

6.1

BATTERY, AA ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG
5613500883

Bidding On
Make: ENERGIZER

Stock Number:EN81

Brand: ENERGIZER

Date of Delivery: §0 DAYS A.R.O

BATTERY, AAA ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG
5613500814

Bidding On
Make:ENERGIZER

Stock Number: EN92

Brand:ENERGIZER

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.O

BATTERY, C ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG
5613500884

Bidding On
Make:ENERGIZER

Stock Number: EN93

8rand: ENERG|ZER

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

BATTERY, D ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG
5613500003

Bidding On
Make: ENERGIZER

Stock Number: EN95

Brand: ENERGIZER

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

BINDER VIEW 2" WHITE
$751001196

Bidding On
Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 3151

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.O

BINDER VIEW 1-1/2" BLACK
§751001200

Bidding On
Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 3147

Brand:BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

200 _PG

200 PG

100 PG

100 PG .

100 EA

100 ¢£A

$266

$266

$3.69

$4.09

$2.56

$1.80

$532.00

$532.00

$369.00

$409.00

$256.00

$180.00
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ITEM UNIT PRICE
NO. DESCRIPTION ary_ UoMm PRICE EXTENSION

@ BINDER VIEW 1/2” BLACK 100 EA $1.25 $125.00
5751001202

Bidding On

Make:BAZIC

Stock Number: 3141

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery:60 DAYS AR.O

BINDER VIEW 1" BLACK 100 EA $1.45 $145.00

5751000001

Bidding On
Make:; BAZIC

Stock Number: 3122
Brand: BAZIC
Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O E—

BINDER VIEW 1” BLUE 100 EA $1.45 $145.00
$751001039

Bidding On
Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 3191
Brand:BAZIC
Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

@ BINDER VIEW 3" WHITE 100 EA $3.70 $.370.00
5751001258

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stack Number:3175

Brand:BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.O N

@ansn VIEW 1-1/2” BLUE 50 EA $1.62 - $81.00
§751001040 ‘

Bidding On

Make:BAZIC

Stock Number:; 3192
Brand:BAZIC

Date of Delivery:60 DAYS AR.O

12.1 / BINDER VIEW 2" BLACK 100 EA $2.56 $256.00
5751000391

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 3150

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.C
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ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION Qary  Uom

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

@ CLIPBOARD LEGAL SIZE; WOOD 20 EA
§752000004

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 1804

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

’20.1 CLIPBOCARD LETTER SIZE WOOD 20 EA
$751000006

Bidding On

Make:BAZIC

Stock Number:_1805
Brand:BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

21.1 DISC, CD BLANK " 500 EA
5583500595

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

22.1 DISPENSER, TAPE 1-1/2 500 MODEL 20 EA
5752000060

Bidding On
Make:
Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

23.1 DISPENSER, TAPE UP TC 1" IM 20 EA
C-25
§752000433

Bidding On

Make: 3M

Stock Number: C60-BK
Brand: 3M
Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.O

24.1 ENVELOPE WHITE # 10 100 BX
SELF SEAL PLAIN 500/BX
5753000811

Bidding On
Make:BAZIC

Stock Number: 5064
Brand: BAZIC
Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

$1.20

$0.90

¢ NO BID

$NOBID

$2.44

$13.50

$24.00

$18.00

SNOBID

$NO BID

$48.80

$1,350.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

ary uom

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

25.1

26,1

27.1

28.1

30.1

ENVELOPE WINDOW # 10
SELF SEAL WINDOW WHITE 500/BX
$753000819

Bidding On
Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 5458
Brand:BAZIC
Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.C

ENVELOPE 9X12
OPEN/KRAFT 250/BX CAT.
$753000087 100/BOX

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 5072

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery:60 DAYS AR.O

ENVEL. 10”"X13"INTER-DEPT./MESS
100/8X
5753009839

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

ENVELOPE CLASP 7X10 KRAFT
100/8X
5753000658

Bidding On
Make:
Stock Number;
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

ERASER, WHITEBOARD 5"
5751001259

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 2229

Brand: BAZ|C

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

FASTENER W/BASE 2", 50/8X
5751000136

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

100 BX

50 BX

50 BX

50 BX

20 EA

200 BX

$20.25

$12.50

SNOBID

$NO BID

$1.25

$NO BID

$2.02500

$625.00

SNO BID

$NOC BID

$25.00

$NO BID
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ITEM UNIT PRICE
NO. _ DESCRIPTION Qry uom PRICE EXTENSION

43.1 FOLDER LTR MANILA 106  BX $9.32 $932.00
1/3 CUT 100/BX
§751000128

Bidding On

Make:BAZIC

Stock Number: 3184 —_—
Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery:60 DAYS A.R.O

44.1 FOLDER LYR ORANGE STRAIGHT TAB 100 BX s NO BID $NO BID
W/FASTENERS, 100/BX
5$751001276

Bidding On

Make:
. Stock Number:

Brand:

Date of Delivery:

45.1 FOLDER LTR PURPLE STRAIGHT TAB 100 BX $NOBID $NOBID
W/FASTENERS, 100/BX
5$751001274

Bidding On .
Make:

Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

46.1 FOLDER LTR TEAL 100/BX 100 BX $NO BID SNO BID
5751001272

Bidding On
Make:
Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

@ FOLD LEG MANILA 1/3 CUT 100 BX $10.50 $1.050.00

100/BX
5751000131

Bidding Gn

Make:BAZIC

Stock Number: 3181

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery:60 DAYS AR.O

48.1 FOLD LTR MANILA 1" EXPD POCKET 100 BX $ BID $NO BID
50/BX
§751000129

Bidding On
Make:
Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

Qry UOM

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

49.1

50.1

511

52.1

53.1

54.1

HI - LITER, YELLOW
12 EA/DZ
$751001254

Bidding On
Make: BAZIC

Stock Number:2332

Brand: BAZIC .

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

i
HI - LITER, GREEN
12 EAfDZ
$751001255

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number:

Brand:

Date of Delivery:

INK ROLL ON STAMP, BLACK 2 FL OZ
5751000821

Bidding On
Make: CARTERS

Stock Number:614993

Brand:CARTERS

Date of Delivery;: 60 DAYS AR.O

INK ROLL ON STAMP, BLUE 2 FL OZ
$751000623

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number:;

Brand:

Date of Delivery:

LABELS, END TAB FILING COLOR
CODED {F) 1 X 1.25, WHITE/RL
5753009842

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number;

Brand:

Date of Delivery:

LABELS, END TAB FILING COLOR
CODED {M) 1 X 1.25, WHITE/RL
5704501093

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number:

Brand:

Date of Delivery:

200 D2

100 DZ

20 EA

50 AL

50 RL

$3.38

$NO BID

$6.75

$NO BID

$NOBID

$NO BID

$676.00

$NO BID

$33.75

$NO BID

$NO BID

SNO BID
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

Qry___Uuom

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

67.1

68.1

69.1

711

PAD RULED LTR WHITE
12 PDS/PG
§$753000243

Bidding On
Make:_.

Stock Number:
Brand;
Date of Delivery:

PAD RULED 5"X8"” WHITE
12 PDS/PG
5753000885

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 556

Brand:BAZIC

Date of Delivery:80 DAYS A.R.O

PAD STENO 6"X9"
80 SHT/PD, 12PD/PG
5753000285

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 577

Brand:BAZIC

Date of Delivery:60 DAYS AR.Q

PAPERCOPY 8 % X 11 BLUE
10 RMS/CS
5753000844

Bidding On

Make: BOSIE FIREWORX

Stock Number: MP-2201-BE
Brand: FIREWORX

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.O

PEN, MECH. LEAD .5MM
TUBE/REFILLS
$751000443

Bidding On
Make;
Stock Number:
Brand;
Date of Delivery:

PEN, TRANSLUCENT BLACK, 12/D2
$751001267

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 1755

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

100 PG

50 PG

100 PG

50 RM

20 TUBE

200 _DzZ

$NO BID

$558

$9.55

$7.70

S NO BID

$0.99

$NO BID

$279,00

$955.00

$.385.00

s NO BID

5.198.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION Qry UcMm

LUNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

PEN, TRANSLUCENT BLUE, 12/b2 200 DZ
5751001266

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 1756

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.Q

PEN, BALL POINT BLUE, 12/02 200 DZ
5752001195

" Bidding On

75.1

77.1

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number:; 17005

8rand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.Q

PENCIL SHARPENER, ELECTRIC 20 EA
STANDARD SiZE
5752000500

Bidding On

Make: X-ACTD

Stock Number: 54800881

8rand: X-ACTD

Date of Delivery: 80 DAYS A.R.O

PENCIL, WOOD # 2 AMERICAN, 12/DZ w00 D2
5751000246

Bidding On
Make: BAZIC (PLEASE REVIEW LITERATURE}

Stock Number:_763
Brand: BAZIC
Date of Delivery: 50 DAYS A.R.O

PERFORATOR PAPER, 2 HOLE 100 EA
5752001208

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

PORTFOLIO D/PKT BLUE 25/BX 50 EA
§751000589

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 2183

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.O

$.0.99

$0.99

$.34.40

$0.99

$NO BID

$7.42

$.198.00

5198.00

$ 688.00

599.00

S$NOBID

$371.00
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ITEM UNIT PRICE
NO. DESCRIPTION Q7Y UomM PRICE EXTENSION
79.1 POST IT FLAGS (PLAIN COLOR} 50/PK 250 PKG $089 $222.50
$651500002 250/PACK
Bidding On '
Make: BAZIC (PLEASE REVIEW LITERATURE)
Stock Number:_5154
Brand: BAZIC
Date of Delivery:60 DAYS A.R.O
80.1 POST IT FLAGS (SIGN HERE) 50/PK 250  PKG $099 $247.50
$751001264 100/PACK
Bidding On
Make: BAZIC
Stock Number: 5172
Brand:BAZIC
Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.O
81.1 POSTIT NOTE, 3" X5”, YELLOW, 12/PK 100 PKG $7.93 $793.00
5751001100 100/CT
Bidding On
Make: BAZIC
Stock Number: 5112
Brand: BAZIC
Date of Dalivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O
POST IT NOTE, 3X3 CANARY 100 ~PKG §445 $44500
100 SHEET, 12/PK
5651500001 (YELLOW)
Bidding On
Make: BAZIC
Stock Number: 5160
Brand: BAZIC
Date of Delivery: 50 DAYS AR.Q
83.1 POST IT NOTE, 2X2, ASSORTED 100 PKG $NOBID sNOBID
12/PK
S651500003
Bidding On
Make:
Stock Number:
Brand;
Date of Delivery: —_—
84.t RECORD BOOK LEG 300 EA $NOBID _ $NOBID _
W/OUT INDEX 500 PGS
§753000017
Bidding On
Make:
Stock Number:
Brand:

Date of Delivery:
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

Qry  uom

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

85.1

- 86.1

87.1

88.1

920.1

RUBBER BAND #64
1/4 LB/PX
§751000793 207./56.70G

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 6102

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 80 DAYS A.R.O

RUBBER BAND #16
1/4 LB/PK,
5751000015

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

RULER TRANSPARENT 12" PLASTIC
§$752000303

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 325

Brand:BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.O

RULER TRANSPARENT 18" PLASTIC
5752000306

Bidding On
Miake:
Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

SCISSORS PLASTIC HANDLE 8"
5511000029

Bidding On

Make; BAZIC

Stock Number; 4435

Brand; BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS AR.O

SIDETABS SELF-STICK, 1 X 1,25, NUMERIC
WHITE, 500/ROLL, 10 ROLLS/BX, 0-9
§753009841

Bidding On
Make;
Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

50 PKG

50 PKG

100 EA

i00 EA

106 PR

100 BX

$0.75

$NO BID

$0.40

$NO BID

$0.89

$NO BID

$37.50

$ NO BID

5.40.00

s NO BID

$89.00

$.NO BID
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ITEM
NO.

UNIT
PRICE

PRICE
EXTENSION

99.1

DESCRIPTION ory  UoMm

STAPLER DESK 6-1/2 100 EA
310D/550 BLACK STANDARD
§752000316

Bidding On

Make: BAZ|C
Stock Number: 681
Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery; 60 DAYS AR.O

STAPLES STANDARD SIZE 100 BX
5000/BX
5752000275

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 608

Brand:; BAZIC

Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

TAPE CALCULATOR 2-1/4" 250 EA
5753000058

Bidding On
Make:

Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

)
TAPE CORRECTION 5MM X 6M 2WAY 500 EA
$751001252 5mmX236"

1011

102.1

Bidding On
Make: BAZIC

Stock Number: 1631
Brand: BAZ|C
Date of Delivery: 60 DAYS A.R.O

TAPE MASKING 2" X 60 YDS 3M 100 RL

234 High Temp.

5751000348 BIDDING BAZIC PRODUCT
1.88"X60YDS

Bidding On

Make: BAZIC DU

Stock Number: 956

Brand: BAZIC

Date of Delivery:_ 60 DAYS AR.O

TAPE TRANSPARENT 600 1/2 X 36 50 RL
CLEAR
§751000523

Bidding On
Make:
Stock Number:
Brand:
Date of Delivery:

$3.37

$074

sNO BID

$075

$1.95

$NOBID

$.337.00

$74.00

$ NO BID

$.375.00

$185.00

$ NO BID
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ITEM UNIT PRICE
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry Uom PRICE EXTENSION

@ COPIER PAPER; BLUE 50  REAMS $_7.70/RM ¢ 385.00
8.5" X 11" (216 X 279mm) -

500 SHT/20 LBS; 10 RM5/CS.
5753000844

Bldding On
BRAND/MAKE: BOSIE FIREWQRX

PLACE OF ORIGIN: U.S.A
STOCK NO./REQORDER NO: MP-2201-BE
DATE OF DELIVERY: 60 DAYS AR.O

This is an “INDEFINITE QUANTITY BID”. The Term of this contract is one {1) year on an as needed basis upon
avallability of funds. Prices must remain the same for a period of one {1) year. Contract term maybe extended for
an additional three (3} months.

These specifications were prepared by CHARLEEN EVANGELISTA, STOREKEEPER | of the General Services Agency
and approved by: DAVID CRUZ, ASST. CHIEF PROCUREMENT OFFICER

TOTAL BID AMOUNT : § 38,788.05
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