
GSA-046-20 OFFICE SUPPLIES AWARD LISTING 

Item 

No.: Description: Qty. UOM 

AMERICAN 

PRINTING 

ST 

CORP. 

SUN 

LEADER 

Triple 

7 

M.D. 

WHOLESALES 

JMI 

EDISON 

13.1 CLIP STANDARD #1, 100/Bx 200 NO BID 0.80 0.40 0.75 0.94 BX NO BID 

S751000052 

Bidding On: 

Make: Paper Clip #1 

Stock No.: 99063-1 

Brand: Genmes 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As Specified) 

14.1 CLIP, DBL MINI COLOR ASSORTED 24/BX 200 BX NO BID NO BID 4.00 2.95 0.80 8.60 

S751001250 W/Draw 10/28/20 Offered: 20/pk 

Bidding On: 

Make: OK 

Stock No.: 31024 

Brand: OIC 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

15.1 CLIP, DBL, 1-1/2" X 5x8, ASSORTED COLOR 200 BX NO BID NO BID 5.00 3.95 0.80 NO BID 

SM, 12/BX W/Draw 10/28/20 Offered: 8/pk 

S751001249 

Bidding On: 

Make: OIC 

Stock No.: 31029 

Brand: OIC 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

16.1 CLIP, DBL, 1/2" X 3x8, ASSORTED COLOR 200 BX NO BID NO BID 3.50 2.95 NO BID NO BID 

SM, 12/BX W/Draw 10/28/20 

5751001248 

Bidding On: 

Make: Paper Clip Color Small 

i  Stock No.: 31028 

Brand: OK 'Revised 1/04/21" 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified) 
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33.1 FLASH DRIVE 32GB 200 14.50 11.50 25.00 7.01 EA 14.70 10.75 

5752001201 

Bidding On: 

Make: Kinston 

Stock No.: 002852261-New 

Brand: Kingston 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days ARO 

34.1 FOLDER LETTER PRESBRD 2 Div/6 SEC 100 BX NO BID NO BID 39.00 30.00 NO BID 60.52 

BRK-RED/10 BX W/Draw 10/28/20 

5751001268 

Bidding On: 

Make: Classification Folder 

Stock No.: 1257R 

Brand: Pendaflex 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specifiedi 

35.1 FOLDER MANILA LEGAL GRAY 100/BX 100 28.00 22.00 NO BID 31.18 --bx - NO 511) - NO 131D 

5751001127 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Legal Gray Folder 

Stock No.: 153-1/3Gray 

Brand: Pendaflex 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified) 

36.1 FOLDER LEG MANILA 1/5 CUT, 100/BX 100 BX NO BID NO BID 15.00 12.00 10.27 17.63 

S751000127 W/Draw 10/28/20 Offered: 1/3 Cut 

Bidding On: 

Make: Manila Folder Legal 

Stock No.: 753 -1/5 

Brand: Pendaflex 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. "Revised 1/04/21' 
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41.1 FOLDER LTR BLUE STRAIGHT TAB 100 BX NO BID NO BID 45.00 35.00 NO BID 41.54 

W/FASTENERS, 50/BX 

5751001275 

Bidding On: 

Make: Letter Blue Folder w/Fasteners 

Stock No.: 21301 

Brand: Pendafex 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified) 

42.1 FOLDER LTR. GREEN, 100/BX 100 BX NO BID NO BID 22.50 17.00 29.72 25.20 

5751001273 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Green Folder Letter 
Stock No.: 4210-1/3BGR 
Brand: Pendafex 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified} 

43.1 FOLDER LTR MANILA 1/3 CUT, 100/BX 100 BX NO BID NO BID 12.50 9.00 9.32 26.10 

S751000128 

Bidding On: 

Make: Manila Folder Letter 
Stock No.: 3184 

Brand: Bazic 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified} 

44.1 FOLDER LTR ORANGE STRAIGHT TAB 100 BX NO BID NO BID 45.00 38.00 NO BID 33.74 

W/FASTENERS, 100/BX Offered: W/Draw 10/28/20 Offered: 

5751001276 50/Pk 50/Pk 

Bidding On: 

Make: 

Stock No.: 

Brand: 'Revised 1/04/21" 

Date of Delivery: 
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45.1 FOLDER LTR PURPLE STRAIGHT TAB 

w/FAsTENERs, 100/BX 

100 BX NO BID NO BID 49.00 

Offered: 

40.00 

W/Draw 10/28/20 

NO BID 33.74 

Offered: 

5751001274 50/Pk 50/Pk 

Bidding On: 

Make: 

Stock No.: 

Brand: 

Date of Delivery: 

46.1 FOLDER LTR TEAL 100/BX 100 BX NO BID NO BID 22.50 17.00 NO BID NO BID 

5751001272 VV/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 
Make: Teal Folder Letter 

Stock No.: 4210-1/3TEA 

Brand: Pendaflex 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified) 

47.1 FOLD LEG MANILA 1/3 CUT, 100/BX 100 BX NO BID NO BID 14.50 11.00 10.50 15.11 

5751000131 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Bazic 
Stock No.: 3181 
Brand: Bazic 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

48.1 FOLD LTR MANILA 1" EXPD POCKET, 50/BX 100 BX NO BID NO P.ID 38.00 28.00 NO BID 27.43 
S751000129 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: PENDAFLEx 

Stock No.: 22100EE 
Brand: Pendaflex 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 'Revised 1/04/21" 
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61.1 MECH. LEAD PENCIL .5MM EACH 50 EA NO BID NO BID 0.80 0.30 0.90 14.69 

5751000247 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Mechanical Pencil 0.5mm 
Stock No.: 720 

Brand: Bazic 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specifiedi 

62.1 MECH. LEAD PENCIL .7MM EACH 50 EA NO BID NO BID 0.80 0.30 0.90 14.69 

5751001269 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 
Make: Mechanical Pencil 0.7mm 

Stock No.: 755 
Brand: Bozic 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified) 

63.1 MOISTENER SORTKWIK (LARGE) 300 EA NO BID NO BID 4.50 3.80 NO BID NO BID 

5752001202 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Finger Moistener 

Stock No.: LEE-10132 

Brand: SortKwik 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified) 

64.1 PAD RULED LTR 5" X 8" CANARY, 12/PDS/PG 20 PG NO BID NO BID 7.50 6.00 5.39 18.28 

5753000474 W/Draw 10/28/20 Offered: 

Bidding On: 	Pad Ruled 5)(8, 12/Pds/Pg. 50 ct/Pd/Pg 

Make: Ampad Pad Ruled 
Stock No.: 20-264 
Brand: Ampad 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. "Revised 1/04/21" 
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65.1 PAD RULED LEG CANARY, 12/PDS/PG 50 PG NO BID NO BID 15.50 12.50 8.50 29.68 

S753000241 W/Draw 10/28/20 Offered: 8.5 x 11.75 '-' 

Bidding On: 

Make: Pad Ruled Legal 

Stock No.: 20-263 

Brand: Ampad 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

66.1 PAD RULED LEG WHITE, 12/PDS/PG 50 PG NO BID NO BID 15.50 12.50 8.50 17.41 

S753000244 W/Draw 10/28/20 Offered: 8.5 x 11.75 

Bidding On: 
Make: Pad Ruled Legal 
Stock No.: 20-363 

Brand: Ampad 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

67.1 PAD RULED LTR WHITE, 12/PDS/PG 100 PG NO BID NO BID 11.00 8.75 NO BID NO BID 

5753000243 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 
_ 

Make: Pad Ruled Letter 
Stock No.: 5039 
Brand: Bazic 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specifiedi 

68.1 PAD RULED 5" X 8" WHITE, 12/PDS/PG 50 PG NO BID NO BID 7.50 6.00 5.58 11.53 

5753000885 W/Draw 10/28/20 	Offered: 

Bidding On: Offer: 12/Pds/Pg. 50 Ct/Pds/Pg. 

Make: Ampad Pad Ruled 
Stock No.: 20-364 
Brand: Ampad 
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

'Revised 1/04/21" 
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69.1 PAD STENO 6" X 9", 80 SHT/PD, 12/PDS/PG 100 PG NO BID NO BID 25.00 20.00 9.55 32.98 

5753000285 W/Draw 10/28/20 Offered: 

Bidding On: Offer: 80sht/Pd, 12/Pds/Pg. 50 Ct./Pds/Pg. 

Make: Steno Pad 6x9 

Stock No.: 25-274 

Brand: Ampad 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

70.1 PAPERCOPY 81/2 X 11 BLUE, 10 RMS/CS 50 RM 8.60 NO BID 10.50 8.50 7.70 15.30 

5753000844 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Bosie FireWorx 

Stock No.: MP-2201-BE 

Brand: FireWorx 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

71.1 PEN, MECH. LEAD .5MM, TUBE/REFILLS 20 0.60 0.30 NO BID 4.27 TUBE NO BID NO BID 

5751000443 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Mechanical Pencil Lead 
Stock No.: 782 

Brand: Bazic 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As Specified) 

72.1 PEN, TRANSLUCENT BLACK, 12/DZ 200 DZ NO BID NO BID 4.50 2.00 0.99 17.25 

S751001267 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Bazic 

Stock No.: 1755 

Brand: Bazic 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 
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81.1 POST IT NOTE, 3" X 5", YELLOW, 12/PK 100 PKG NO BID NO BID 11.50 6.50 7.93 32.44 

5751001100 

Bidding On: 

Make: Post It Notes 

Stock No.: SPR19784 

Brand: Business Source 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified} 

82.1 POST IT NOTE, 3X3 CANARY 100 SHT., 12/PK 100 PK NO BID NO BID 7.50 5.50 4.45 18.85 

5651500001 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Bazic 

Stock No.: 5160 

Brand: Bazic 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

83.1 POST IT NOTE, 2X3 ASSORTED, 12/PK 100 PKG NO BID NO BID 18.00 12.00 NO BID 16.08 

S651500003 

Bidding On: 

Make: Post It Note 2" x 2" 

Stock No.: EB06 

Brand: Early Buy 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified} 

84.1 RECORD BOOK LEG W/OUT INDEX, 500 PGS. 300 EA NO BID NO BID 69.50 NO BID NO BID 29.13 

5753000017 Offered: 

Bidding On: 12-1/8 x 7-5/8 

Make: Record Book Legal 

Stock No.: 9-500-R 

Brand: Oxford 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

'Revised 1/04/21" 



GSA-046-20 OFFICE SUPPLIES AWARD LISTING 

Item 

No.: Description: Qty. UOM 

AMERICAN 

PRINTING 

ST 

CORP. 

SUN 

LEADER 

Triple 

7 

M.D. 

WHOLESALES 

JMI 

EDISON 

85.1 RUBBER BAND #64, 1/4 LB/PK 50 PKG NO BID NO BID 1.60 1.20 0.75 3.22 

5751000793 W/Draw 10/28/20 Offered: 
_ 

Bidding On: 	Offered: #64 1/4 lb. 1/8 lb. 

Make: Rubber Band 

Stock No.: UNV00464 

Brand: Universal 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

86.1 RUBBER BAND #16, 1/4 LB/PK 50 PKG NO BID NO BID 1.60 1.20 NO BID 7.70 

5751000015 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Rubber Band 

Stock No.: UNV00416 

Brand: Universal 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified) 

87.1 RULER TRANSPARENT 12" PLASTIC 100 EA NO BID NO BID 0.90 0.40 0.40 4.41 

5752000303 Same Offer Same Offer 

Bidding On: 

Make: Ruler Transparent 12" — 
Stock No.: 325 

Brand: Bazic 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified) 

88.1 RULER TRANSPARENT 18" PLASTIC 100 EA NO BID NO BID 7.50 2.50 NO BID 6.16 

S752000306 

Bidding On: 
Make: Ruler 18" 

Stock No.: ACM-10564 
Brand: Westcoot "Revised 1/04/21" 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified) 
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93.1 STAMP PAD RED SMALL 4X6 50 3.50 1.80 NO BID 14.84 -tA 14.00 NO BID 

5751001241 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Stamp Pad Red 

Stock No.: 4100-AAA 

Brand: Genmes 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified( 

94.1 STAMPER INK REFILL 10 cc/BT. RED 50 BT 350 NO BID 1.50 030 NO BID NO BID 

5751000816 W/Draw 10/28/20 

Bidding On: 

Make: Ink Refill Red, 24ml 

Stock No.: 290073 

Brand: Genmes 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified( 

95.1 STAMPER RUBBER "DRAFT" 50 EA 15.00 NO BID 7.50 3.50 NO BID 12.43 

5752001128 W/Draw 10/28/20 
_ 

Bidding On: 

Make: Stamp "Draft" 

Stock No.: 5PR60017 

Brand: Sparc() 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified) 

96.1 STAPLE REMOVER WMANDLE 100 EA NO BID NO BID 2.90 1.50 0.82 2.80 

$752001194 Offered: Claw Type 

Bidding On: 

Make: Staple Remover w/Handle 
Stock No.: 5092 

Brand: Genmes 

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O. 

'Revised 1/04/21" 
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