GENERAL SERVICE AGENCY
{Ahensian Setbision Hinirat)
Government of Guam
590 South Marie Drive, Ste. 219 ITC Bldg., Tamuning, GU 96913
Tel: 477-1710-13 Fax: 472-4217 / 475-1716/27

Accountability * Impartiality * Competence * Openness * Value

BID STATUS

December 21, 2020
AMERICAN PRINTING CORP
Attn: LILY W. Yu, Vice President
256 Chalan San Antonio
Tamuning, Guam 96913
Tel: (671) 646-7873 / Fax: (671) 649-0712
Email: admin@apc-guam.com / apc@teleguam.net

BID INVITATION NO.: GSA-046-20 OPENING DATE: October 23, 2020

OFFICE SUPPIES
The following is the result of the above-mentioned bid. Refer to the items checked below.

[ ] Cancelled (in its entirety), or partially cancelled due to:
( ) Insufficient funds:
( ) Change of specifications; or
{ ) Insufficient number of bidders.

[X] Rejected due to:
( ) Late submission of bid;
( ) No bid security or insufficient bid security;
( ) Not meeting the delivery requirement-as-stated-n the-1FB;
( ) Non-conformance with requirement of IFB;
(X)  High price
(X) Others

REMARKS: See attached listing

[X] Bid recommended for award: Multiple Awards see attached listing.

REMARKS: Thank vou for your participation with this bid. Please send your authorized representative to
pickup vour original bid status and cashier check/bid bond or Standby Letter of Credit.

@ | .L FAL%

CLAUDIA S. A
Chief Procurement Officer

Please Print
JACKNOWLEDGEMENT CcOPY (Re-fax to GSA)
Received By:
Date:
Company Name:

Fax to: 475-1727 or 472-4217
E-mail to: gsapmcurement@gsadoa.guam.gov




Item
No.:

Description:

Qty.

Uom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

1)
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple
7

M.D.
WHOLESALES

I
EDISON

1.1

2.1

3.1

4.1

BATTERY, AA ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG
5$613500883

Bidding On:

Make: AA Battery

Stock No.; 25384

Brand: Energizer

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

BATTERY, AAA ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG
5613500814

Bidding On:

Make: AAA Battery

Stock No.: 33640

Brand: Energizer

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

BATTERY, C ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG
5613500884

Bidding On:

Make: ENERGIZER C 2/PK

Stock No.: E93BP2 (Ener-£E93001)
Brand: ENERGIZER

Date of Delivery: 60 Days ARO

BATTERY, D ENERG ALKAL, 2/PG
5613500003

Bidding On:

Make: ENERGIZER D 2/PK

Stock No.: E95BP2 {Ener-E95001)
Brand: ENERGIZER

Date of Delivery: 60 Days ARD

200

200

PG

=)

NO BID

P EMIY

100

100

&

PG

PG

NO BID

NG BID

2.30

~2.30

3.00

3.25

1.90

1.90

[Fa]
R
o

L
[Py
L

(.85

W/Braw 10/28/20

8.85
W braw 10728420

4.00

4.00

2.60

2.66

3.609

4.09

3.42

6.71

(.59

7.11




item
No.:

Description:

Qty.

Uuom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

ST
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

Imi
EDISON

5.1

6.1

1.1

81

BINDER VIEW 2" WHITE
§751001196

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 3151

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 80 Days ARD

BINDER VIEW 1-1/2" BLACK
§751001200

Bidding On:

Make: View Binder 1.5" Black

Stock No.: 3147

Brand; Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As Specified)

BINDER VIEW 1/2" BLACK
5751001202

Bidding On;:
Make: Bazic
Stock No.: 3141
8rand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.Q.

BINDER VIEW 1" BLACK
§751000001

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 3122

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

100

EA

NO BID

100

100

EA~

EA

TUNOUBRT |

NG Bilx

100

EA

NG BID

N BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

3.50

2.80

1.80

1.80

2.60
WGraws 18728720

1.60

1.30
W/ Draw 10/28/20

1.30
Wi Oraw 10/28720

1.80

1.45

12.50

10.08

4.55




Item
No.:

Description:

Qty.

uom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

ST
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

WHOLESALES

IMI
EDISON

9.1

10.1

1i.1

12.1

BINDER VIEW 1" BLUE
5751001035

Bidding On:
Make: Bazic
Stock No.: 3191
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

BINDER VIEW 3" WHITE
S$751001258

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.; 3171

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

BINDER VIEW 1-1/2" BLUE
$751001040

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.; 3192

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O,

BINDER VIEW 2" BLACK
§751000391

Bidding On:
Make: Bazic
Stock No.: 3150
Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

100

100

50

EA

EA

EA

NO BiD

NO BID

NO 81D

100

EA

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NG BID

NO 8ID

2.50

4.96

3.50

1.60
W/ Draw AD/2B/20

3.80
W/Graw 10/28/20

2.00
W/Draw 10/28/20

2.60
W/Draw 10/28/20

8.65

16.88

10.08

10.69




Item
No.:

Dascription:

Oty.

Uom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

IMI
EDISON

13.1

14.1

15.1

16.1

CLIP STANDARD #1, 100/Bx
§751000052

Bidding On:

Make: Paper Clip #1
Stock No.: 99063-1
Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As Specified

CLIP, DBL MINI COLOR ASSORTED 24/8X
§751001250

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 263

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.Q.

CLIP, DBL, 1-1/2" X 5xB, ASSORTED COLOR
SM, 12/8X

§751001249

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 264

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery; 60 Days A.R.O.

CLIP, DBL, 1/2" X 3x8, ASSORTED COLOR
SM, 12/BX
$751001248

Bidding On:
Make: Paper Cli
Stock No.: 31028
Brand: QIC

Color Smal}

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

200

200

BX

8x

| NGEID

NO BID

200

200

BX

NO BiD

BX

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

MO BID

0.50

4.00

t

2.595
W/Draw 10/28/20

3.85
Wilraw 10/28/26G

2.8%
W/ Draw 10/28/20

0.75

.80

NO BID

0.94

8.60

NO BID

NO BID




ltem AMERICAN ST SUN Triple M.D. M
No.: |Description: Qty. UOM | PRINTING CORP. LEADER 7 WHOLESALES EDISON
17.1 |[CLIP, DBL, 1/4" MINI BLACK, 12/8BX 200 BX MO BID NO BID 0.50 0.35 0.75 9.62
5751001139 W/Baw 10/28/20
Bidding On:
Make: Paper Clip Black
Stock No.: 600801
Brand: Genmes
Date of Delivery: &0 Days {As specified
18.1 [CLIP, DBL 2" ASSORTED COLOR LG, 12/BX 200 BX NG BID NO BID 6.00 4.50 6.958 9.26
5751001251 W/Draw 10/28/20
Bidding On:
Make: Paper Clip Color Large
Stock No.: 653631
Brand: Business Source -
Date of Delivery: &0 Days {As specified)
19.1 |CLIPBOARD LEGAL §IZE; WOOD 20 EA NG BID NO BID 2.50 1.5 1.20 3.06
$752000004 W/Draw 10/28/20
Bidding On:
Make: Bazic
Stock No.: 1804
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 80 Days A.R.O.
20.1 |CLIPBOARD LETTER SIZE WOOD 20 EA N0 BID NO BID 2.00 1.30 0.90 206
5751000006 WDrave 10/28/20

Bidding On:

iake: Bazic

Stock No.; 1804

Brand: Bazic_

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.




itemn
No.:

Description:

Qty.

uom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

v
EDISON

21.1

22.1

23.1

24.1

DISC, CD BLANK
5583500595

Bidding On:

Make: CD-R

Stock No.: 77990

Brand: Verbatim

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

DISPENSER, TAPE 1-1/2 500 MODEL
5752000060

Bidding On:

Make: Tape Dispenser Large 3" Core
Stock No,: 3300

Brand: Genmes

DISPENSER, TAPE UP TO 1" 3Mm C-25
$752000433

Bidding On:

Make: Tape Dispenser Medium 1" Care
Stock No.: 3310

Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery: 80 Days {As specified)

ENVELOPE WHITE #10 SELF SEAL
PLAIN, 500/BX
5753000811

Bidding On:

iMake: #10 Envelopes Plain White
Stock No.: 5064

8rand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified}

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

500

EA

NCy BID

20

20

EA

EA

NG B

o
-

NO BID

NG BIE

NO BID

WO BID

©
HEH
plany

e
[*al
)

48.00

0,22
W/ Braw 10738720

600
W/Draw 10728726

NO BID

NO BID

2.44

1350

0.31

NO BID

34.39

29.25




Item
Np.:

Description:

Qty.

UOM

AMERICAN
PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEAGER

M.D.
WHOLESALES

IMI
EDISON

25.1

26.1

27.1

28.1

ENVELOPE WINDOW #10 SELF SEAL
WINDOW, WHITE 500/BX
S$753000810

Bidding On:

Make: #10 Envelopes, Window

Stock No.: 5456

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

ENVELOPE 9X12 OPEN/KRAFT 250/BX. CAT
5753000087

Bidding On:
Make: Quality Park
Stock No.: 37590

Brand: Quality Park
(ate of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O,

ENVEL. 10"X13" INTER-DEPT./MESS 100/BX
5$753009839

Bidding On:
Make: Inter-Office, Envelopes, Kraft
Stock No.: 63561

Brand: Quality Park
Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

ENVELOPE CLASP 7X10 KRAFT 100/BX
5753000698

Bidding On:
Make: ULINE

Stock No.: 5-12799
Brand: ULINE

Date of Delivery: 60 Days ARQ

1006

BX

50

50

BX

BX

NO BID

NG BID

50

BX

NO BIEZ

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID

47.00

42.00

39.00

28.00

35.00

WiDraw 16128720

22.00
W/braw 10/28/20

Tt
i
+o
=

12.50
Offered:

100/Bx

NO BiD

NO BID

24.684

33.75

16.25




ftem
Na.:

Description:

Qty.

ST
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple
7

M.D.
WHOLESALES

Jivil
EDISON

29.1

30.1

311

32.1

ERASER, WHITEBOARD 5"
5751001259

Bidding On:
Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 2229
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery:; 60 Days A.R.O.

FASTENER W/BASE 2", 50/BX
551000136

Bidding On:

Make: Fasteners
Stock No.: 7017
Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified}

FLASH DRIVE 16GB
5752001200

Bidding On:
Make: Kingston
Stock No.: A03598287

Brand: Kingston
Date of Delivery: 60 Days ARO

FLASH DRIVE 8GB
5752001199

Bidding On:

Make: 8GB Swivel USB Drive High Speed 2.0
Interface

Stock No.:

Brand: LOGOTECH

Date of Delivery:

20

200

200

100

NG BID

ND BID

780

2.80

2.50

3.00

t
in
[}

840

1.50
Wflraw 10728/38

i

2.00

W/Oraw 10/28/20

7.50

6.00

1.25

NO BIG

2500

19,50

4.23

22.96




Item
No.:

Description:

Qty.

e f AMIERICAN

oM

PRINTING

ST
CORP,

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

M|
EDISON

33.1

33.1

35.1

36.1

FLASH DRIVE 32GB
5752001201

Bidding On:

Make: Kingston

Stock No.: 002852261-New

Brand: Kingston

Date of Delivery: 60 Days ARO
FOLDER LETTER PRESBRD 2 DIV/6 SEC
BRK-RED/10 BX

5751001268

Bidding On:

Make: Classification Folder

Stock No.: 1257R

Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

FOLDER MANILA LEGAL GRAY 100/BX
$751001127

Bidding On:
Make: Legal Gray Folder

Stock No.: 153-1/3Gray

Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

FOLDER LEG MANILA 1/5 CUT, 100/BX
5751400127

Bidding On:
Make: Bazic
Stock No.; 3181
8rand: 8azic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

200

EA

1470

100

160

BX

BX

0 BT

NOBID

146

BX

RO BID

10.75

NO BID

NG BID

NO BID

14.50

39.00

15,400

30.00
WibDraw 10/28/20

22.00
w/Draw 10/28/20

12.00
W/Draw 10/258/20

25.00

NG BID

NO BID

7.01

6.52

31,18

17.63




Item
No.:

Description:

Qty.

UOm

AMERICAN
PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

i
EDISON

371

381

39.1

40.1

FOLDER MANILA LTR BLUE, 100/8X
5751000935

Bidding On:
ivake: Blue Folder Letter
Stock No.: 4210-1/3BLU

8rand: Pendaflex
Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified

FOLDER LTR GOLDENROD, 100/BX
5751000933

Bidding On:

Make; Goldenrod Folder Letter

Stock No.: 12234

Brand: Smead

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

FOLDER MANILA LTR GRAY, 100/8X
5751000936

Bidding On:
Make: Gray Folder Letter
S5tock No.: 4210-1/3GRA

Brand: Pendafex
Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified

FOLDER LETTER, RED, 100/BX
5751000934

Bidding On:
Make: Red Folder Letter
Stock No.: 4210-1/3RED

Brand: Pendafex
Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

100

100

BX

BX

NG 81D

MO BID

100

100

BX

BX

NO Bl

NG BID

NO BID

NO BID

RO BID

NO BID

22.50

23.00

22.50

17.00

25.00
W/lraw 10/28/20

29.72

NO BID

NG BID

29.72

18.29

NO BID

NOBID




Item

Description:

Qty.

Uom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Mm.D.
WHOLESALES

ivi
EDISON

41.1

42.1

43.1

44.1

FOLDER LTR BLUE STRAIGHT TAB
W/FASTENERS, 50/BX

§751001275

Bidding On:

Make: Letter Blue Folder w/Fasteners
Stock No.: 21301

Brand: Pendafex

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

FOLDER LTR. GREEN, 100/BX
§751001273

Bidding On:

Make: Green Folder Letter

Stock No.: 4210-1/3BGR

Brand: Pendafex

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

FOLDER LTR MANILA 1/3 CUT, 100/8X
8751000128

Bidding On:

Make: Manila Folder Letter

Stock No.: 3184

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified

FOLDER LTR ORANGE STRAIGHT TAB
W/FASTENERS, 100/BX
5751001276

Bidding On:

Make: Blue Summit Supplies
Stock No.: BSS-92588-346
Brand: Blue Summit Supplies

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

100

100

BX

BX

80 Bil

NO Bt

100

100

BX

BX

NG 81D

NO BIL

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NCY BIE

45.00

Fd
RS
L
o

17.00

9.00

38.00

NO BID

2972

9.32

NO BID

41.54

25.20

2610

33.74




item AMERICAN 5T SUN Triple .0 i

No.: |Description: Qty. | UOM| PRINTING coRp, LEADER 7 WHOLESALES | EDISON
44.1 |FOLDER LTR ORANGE STRAIGHT TAR 160 BX NO BID MO BID 45.00 38,00 MO BID 33.74
W/FASTENERS, 100/BX
5751001276

Bidding On:
Make: Blue Summit Su
Stock No.: BSS-92588-346
Brand: Biue Summit Supplies
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

45,1 |FOLDER LTR PURPLE STRAIGHT TAB 100 BX MO BID NO BID 49.00 40.00 NO BID 33.74
W/FASTENERS, 100/8X
5751001274

Bidding On:

Make: Blue Summit Supplies
Stock No.: BS5-92588-1058
Brand: Blue Summit Supplies
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

46.1 |FOLDER LTR TEAL, 100/BX 100 |7BX | nomD | NOBID 22.50
5$751001272

Bidding On;
Make: Teal Folder Letter

Stock No.: 4210-1/3TEA

8rand: Pendaflex
Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified}

St

.00 NG BID NG BID

47.1 |FOLD LEG MANILA 1/3 CUT, 100/BX 100 BX NO BID NOBID 14.50 11.00 10,
§751000131

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.; 3181

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.D,

=]
et
=]

1511




Itemn
No.:

Description:

AMERICAN

Qty.

uom

PRINTING

ST
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Tripie

VLD
WHOLESALES

Mt
EDISON

48.1

49.1

50.1

51.1

FOLD LTR MANILA 1" EXPD POCKET, 50/BX
§75100012%

Bidding On:

Make: PENDAFLEX

Stock No.: 22100EE

Brand: Pendaflex

Date of Delivery; 60 Days A.R.Q.

HI-LITER, YELLOW 12 EA/DZ.
5751001254

|Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 3223

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

HI-LITER, GREEN 12 EA/DZ.
5751001255

Bidding On:

Make: Highlighter, Green

Stock Na.: 2304

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days |As specified)

INK ROLL ON STAMP, BLACK 2 FL OZ.
5751000821

Bidding On:

tMake: Inker, Black

Stock No.: AVE21448

Brand: Avery Carter

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

100

200

140

BX

DZ

0z

N BED

NO BID

EA

NO BID

NG BID

N0 BIl

NO BID

3800

.50

28.00

5.00

iy
s

NG 81D

NOBID

.75

27.43

9.10

18.47




item
No.:

Description:

AMERICAN

Qty.

Uom

PRINTING

ST
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

i
EDISON

52.1

53.1

54.1

55.1

INK ROLL ON STAMP, BLUE 2 FL GZ.
5751000623

Bidding On:

Make: Specialty Ink

Stock No.: INK-RLSTP-BLUE
8rand: Specialty Ink
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.Q.

LABELS, END TAB FILING COLOR CODED {F}
1 X 1.25, WHITE/RL
5753009842

Bidding On:

Make:_Labels {F)

Stock No.: 67076

Brand: Smead

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

LABELS, END TAB FILING COLOR CODED (M)
1 X 1.25, WHITE/RL
§753009843

Bidding On:

Make:_Labels (M}

Stock No.:. 67083

8rand: Smead

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

LTO ULTRIUM-4 DATA TAPE MEDIA
5704501093

Bidding On:

Make: IBM
Stock No.: A02192089

Brand: IBM

20

50

50

EA

RL

RL

NG BID

HO BIG

NEYEID

200

EA

NO BID

NO BIE

ND BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

13.50

oo
ind
[%,]
o)
faw

30.00

NO BID

=

NG BID

HO BiD

M BID

MG BID

NO BID

18.47

HOBID

NG BID




Item

Description:

Qty.

Uom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

IMi
EDISON

56.1

57.1

58.1

59.1

LTO ULTRIUM-6 DATA TAPE MEDIA
§704501094

Bidding On:

Make:_IBM

Stock No.: 005029551-New
Brand: 1BM

Date af Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

MARKER, CHISEL BLACK, 12/DZ.
§751001262

Bidding On:

Make:_Marker, Black

Stock No.; 1274

Brand: Bazit

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

MARKER, CHISEL BLUE, 12/DZ.
5751000198

Bidding On:

Make:_Marker, Blue

Stock No.: 1273

8rand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

MARKER, CHISEL RED, 12/DZ.
57510001982

Bidding On;

Make:_Marker, Red

Stock No.: 1273

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days [As specified

200

EA

ND BiT

200

200

Dz

NGO BID

DZ

KO Bl

100

bz

NO BID

NO BID

NOBID

NO BID

NO BB

4500

7.50

7.50

NC BID

3.00

NOBID

NG B8ID

NO BID

31.11




Item
No.:

Description:

AMERICAN

Qty.

Uom

PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

M.,
WHOLESALES

Jmit
EDISON

60.1

61.1

62.1

63.1

MARKER, WHITEBOARD, THICK 6/PK
VARIOQUS COLORS
§752001203

Bidding On:

Make:_Whitehoard Marker

Stock No.: 1259

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

MECH. LEAD PENCIL .5MM EACH
5751000247

Bidding On:

Make: Mechanical Pencil 0.5mm

Stock No.: 720

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

MECH. LEAD PENCIL .70 EACH
5751001269

Bidding On:

Make: Mechanical Pencil 0.7mm

Stock No.: 755

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

MOISTENER SORTKWIK {LARGE)
5752001202

Bidding On:

Make: Finger Moistener

Stock No.. LEE-10132

Brand: SortKwik

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

300

50

PG

NG 81D

EA

NG BID

BICY 246y

300

EA

NO &b

NO Bl

NO &0

NO BID

NO BID

0.30

W/ Draw 10/28/20

.30
W hraw 1728120

3.80

W/hraw 10728/20

b
O
Lad

.90

(.90

NOBID

18.45

14.69
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Item
No.:

Description:

APERIEAN-

Qty.

UOoM

PRINTING

ST
CORP,

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

I
EDISON

64.1

65.1

66.1

67.1

PAD RULED LTR 5" X 8" CANARY, 12/PD5/PG
5753000474

Bidding On:
Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 555
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery; 60 Days A.R.OQ.

PAD RULED LEG CANARY, 12/PDS/PG
5753000241

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 5038

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.Q.

PAD RULED LEG WHITE, 12/PDS/PG
5753000244

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock Nou.: 5039

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O,

PAD RULED LTR WHITE, 12/PDS/PG
5753000243

Bidding On:

Make: Pad Ruled Letter

Stock No.: 5038

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days_(As specified)
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NO BID
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NG BID




Item AMERICAN-T 5T SLIN Triple M.D. B ]|
No.: |Description: Qty. ; UOM | PRINTING CORP, LEADER 7 WHOLESALES EDISON
8.1 |PAD RULED 5" X 8" WHITE, 12/pPD5/PG 50 PG NO BID NO BID 7.50 5.00 5.58 11.53
5753000885 Wiibraw 10/26/20
Bidding On:
Make: Bazic
Stock No.: 556
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.Q.
69.1 |PADSTENO 6" X 9", 80 SHT/PD, 12/PD5/PG 100 PG NI BIG NOBID 25.00 20,00 9,55 32.08
$753000285 : W/braw 10728420
Bidding On;
Make: Bazic
Stock No.: 577
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.Q.
70.1 |PAPERCOPY 8 1/2 X 11 BLUE, 10 RMS/CS 56 260 NQ BID 14.50 B.50 7.70 15.30
5753000844 W/ Draw 10/28/20
Bidding On:
Make: Bosie FireWorx
Stock No.: MP-2201-BE
8rand: FireWorx
[xate of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O,
71.1 |PEN, MECH, LEAD .5VM, TUBE/REFILLS 20 TUBE| ®NO®ID NO BID 0.60 630 NOBID 4,27
5751000443 W/Oraw 10/28/20
Bidding On:
Make: Mechanical Pencil Lead
Stock No.: 782
Brand: Bazic
Date aof Delivery: 60 Days (As Specified)




item
No.:

Description:

Qty.

Uuom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

JMI
EDISON

72.1

731

74.1

75.1

PEN, TRANSLUCENT BLACK, 12/DZ
5751001267

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 1755

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

PEN, TRASLUCENT BLUE, 12/DZ
5751001266

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 1756

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

PEN, BALL POINT BLUE, 12/DZ
57520011595

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 17005

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

PENCIL SHARPENER, ELECTRIC
STANDARD SIZE
5752000500

Bidding On:
Make: Electric Pencil Sharpener

Stock No.: EP1-19500
Brand: X-Acto
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Item AMERICAN 5T SUN Triple M.D. M
No.: |Description: Qty. LOM { PRINTING CORP, LEADER 7 WHOLESALES ECISON
76.1 |PENCIL, WOOD #2 AMERICAN, 12/D7 100 DZ NO Bl NO Bl 1.70 1.20 0.99 3.98
$751000246 W/Draw 10/28/26
Bidding On:
Make: Bazic (Premium Yellow Pencil)
Stock Np.: 763
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.
77.1 |PERFORATOR PAPER, 2 HOLE 100 EA MO BID NOBID 9,50 6.50 NO BID 11.88
S752001208 W Graw 10/28/20
Bidding On:
Make: Punch Two-Hole
Stock No.; 9800
Brand: Genmes
Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)
78.1 |PORTFOLIO D/PKT BLUE, 25/8X 50 EA NO BID MO RID 12.50 9,50 7.42 14.94
$751000589 Wiflraw 30/28/20
Bidding On:
Make: Bazic
Stock No.: 2183
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 80 Days A.R.Q._
79.1 |POST IT FLAGS (PLAIN COLOR) 50/PK 250 | PKG | nNOBID NO 81D 2.50 1.50 0.89 3.54
5651500002 W/Draw 16/28/20 Assorted

Bidding On;
Make: Post It Flags
Stock No.: 5173

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As Specified]




item AMERICAN ST SUN Triple M.D. v
No.: Umwn..mvmu:” Qty. UOM | PRINTING CORP. LEADER 7 WHOLESALES EDISCN
B80.1 |POSTIT FLAGS {SIGN HERE) 50/PK 250 PKG N BID NG BID 2.50 1.50 0.93 3.54
5751001264 W/ Draw 10/28/20
Bidding On: B
Make: Bazic
Stock No.; 5172
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.
81.1 |POSTIT NOTE, 3" X 5", YELLOW, 12/PK 140 PKG NO B NO BID 11.50 .50 7.3 32.44
$751001100
Bidding On;
Make: Post it Notes
Stock No.: SPR19784
Brand: Business Source
Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)
82.1 {POSTIT NOTE, 3X3 CANARY 100 SHT., 12/PK 100 PK NO BID NOBID 7.50 5.50 4.45 18.55
S$A51500001 W/Draw 10/28/20
Bidding On:
Make: Bazic_
Stock No.: 5160 )
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 6{ Days A.R.O,
83.1 |POSTIT NOTE, 2X3 ASSORTED, 12/PK 100 PKG NO BID NO BID 18.00 12.00 NQ BID 16.08

5651500003

Bidding On:
Make: Post it Note 2" x 2"

Stock No.: EBO6

Brand: Early Buy
Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)




Hem
No.:

Description:

Qty.

UOM-

ANMERICAN
“PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

IMI
EDISON

84.1

85.1

86.1

872.1

RECORD BOOK LEG W/OUT INDEX, 500 PGS.
S753000017

Bidding On:
Make: Bogrum & Pease

Stock No.: 66-500-R

Brand: Boorum & Pease

Date of Delivery; 60 Days A.R.O.

RUBBER BAND #64, 1/4 LB/PK
§7510007893

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 6102

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

RUBBER BAND #16, 1/4 LB/PK
5751000015

Bidding On:

Make: Rubber Band

Stock No.: UNV00416

Brand: Universal

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

RULER TRANSPARENT 12" PLASTIC
5752000303

Bidding On:

Make: Ruler Transparent 12"

Stock No.: 325

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)}
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Item
No.:

Description:

Qty.

LOM

AMERICAN
PRINTING

ST
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

M.D.
WHOLESALES

WM
EDISON

88.1

89.1

90.1

911

RULER TRANSPARENT 18" PLASTIC
§752000306

Bidding On:
Make: Ruler 18"

Stock No.: ACM-10564
Brand: Westcoot
Date of Delivery: 60 Days [As specified)

SCISSORS PLASTIC HANDLE 8"
5511000025

Make: Bazic

Stock Np.: 4435

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

SIDETABS SELF-5TICK, 1 X 1.25, NUMERIC
WHITE, 500/ROLL, 10 ROLLS/BX, 0-9
5753009841

8idding On:

Make: Numeric Side Tabs

Stock No.: 67370-67379

Brand: Smead

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

STACKABLE TRAY SMOKE LETTER
5752000304

Bidding On:

Make: Stackable Tray Letter
Stack No.: 21001

Brand: DIC

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified}
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Item
No.:

Description:

Qty.

uom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

ST
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

M.D.
WHOLESALES

HL)
EDISON

92.1

93.1

94.1

85.1

STAMP PAD BLUE SMALL 4X6
5751001240

Bidding On:

Make: Stamg Pad Blue

Stock No.: 4100-EE3

Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

STAMP PAD RED SMALL 4X6
§751001241

Bidding On:

Make: Stamp Pad Red
Stock No.: 4100-AAA

Brand: Genmes
Date of Delivery: 80 Days {As specified)

STAMPER INK REFILL 10 CC/BT. RED
5751000816

Bidding On:

Make: Ink Refill Red, 24m|

Stock No.: 290073

Brand: Genmes

Date of Delivery: 50 Days (As specified)

STAMPER RUBBER "DRAFT"
5752001128

Bidding On:

Make: Stamp "Draft"

Stock No.: SPRE0017

Brand: Sparco

Date of Delivery: 80 Days (As specified)
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Item AMERICAN ST SUN Triple MO, BV ||
No.: Uanl_uﬁn.:" D~<. UOMN | PRINTING CORP. LEADER 7 WHOLESALES EDISON
96.1 |STAPLE REMOVER W/HANDLE 100 EA N BI0 NO BID 290 1.50 0.82 2.80
5752001194
Bidding On:
Make: Bazic (2/Pk)
Stock No.. 613
frand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.
97.1 |STAPLER DESK 6-1/2, 310D/550 100 EA MNOGHD NO BID 49,50 .00 3.37 23.76
BLACK STANDARD W/ Drsw 10/28720
$752000316
Bidding On:
Make: Bazic
Stock No.; 681
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.
98.1 {STAPLES STANDARD SIZE, 5000/BX 100 BX ND BID NO BID 1.20 0.80 n.74 3,949
§752000275 Wi Draw I0728/20
Bidding On:
Make: Bazic
Stock No.: 608
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.D.
99.1 |[TAPE CALCULATOR 2-1/4" 250 EA NO BIT NO BI 6.80 4.50 NO BID 1.56

5753000058

Bidding On:
Make: Caleulator Tape
Stock No.: 08677

Brand: PM Company

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

W/Drave 10/28/20




Item
No.:

Description:

Qty,

uom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple
7

M.D.
WHOLESALES

Jivid
EDISON

100.1

1011

102.1

103.1

TAPE CORRECTION 5MM X 6M 2WAY
§751001252

Bidding On:

Make: Bazic

Stock No.: 1631

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.

TAPE IMASKING 2" X 60 YDS
3M, 234 HIGH TEMP.
5751000348

Bidding On:

Make:_Masking Tape

Stock No.: MMM260048A

Brand: 3M

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As Specified)

TAPE TRANSPARENT 600 1/2 X 36 CLEAR
5751000523

IBidding On:

Make: Transparent Tape

Stock No.: MMM5910121296

Brand: Highland

Date of Delivery: 60 Days (As specified)

TAPE TRANSPARENT 374 X 36 YDS CLEAR
REF: SCOTCH MAGIC [OR EQUAL)
§751001239

Bidding On:

Make: Transparent Tape
Stock No.: 907

Brand: Bazic

Date of Delivery: 50 Days (As specified)
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Item AMERICAN 5T SUN Triple .0, Jivit
No.: [Description: Qfy. | UOM | PRINTING CORP. LEADER 7 WHOLESALES EDISON
104.1 |TAPE FILIMENT 1-1/2 X 60 YDS 50 RL NO BID NO BID 18.00 15.00 NO BIB 13.04
§751000322 WiDravw J0F2B{20
Bidding On:
Make: GGR Supplies
Stock No.: FILAMENTTAPE/FIL-785
Brand: GGR Supplies
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.
105.1 {TAPE FILAMENT 1" X 60 YDS 100 AL MO 2D NO BID 10.50 B.5¢ HO BB 6.30
§751000319 ) - W/ Braw 10/28/20
Bidding On:
Make: 3M
Stock No.: 5-3299
Brand: 3M
Date of Delivery: 60 Days A.R.O.
106.1 [TAPE MASKING 1-1/2 X 60 ¥YDS 100 BL MO BID 250 4.00 1.60 N RID 284
5751000347
Bidding On:
Make: Masking Tape
Stock No.: 953
Brand: Bazic
Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)
107.1 |TAPE TRANSPARENT 600 1" X 72" CLEAR 100 RL NO BID NO BID 11.00 9,00 NO BID 11.13

5751000353

Bidding On:
Make: Transparent Tape

Stock No.: MMMB00D-72-3PK

Brand: 3M

Date of Delivery: 60 Days {As specified)

Wihraw 10/28/20




Item
No.:

Description:

Qty.

uom

AMERICAN
PRINTING

5T
CORP.

SUN
LEADER

Triple

nM.D.
WHOLESALES

Jwvi
EDISON

108.1

21

COPIER PAPER (8,5" X 11")
(216 X 279mm}; 500 SHT/20 LB., 10 RMS/CS
5753000809

Bidding On:

Brand/Make: PAPERLINE
Place of Origin; INDONESIA
Date of Delivery: 5 - 60 DAYS

COPIER PAPER; BLUE, 8.5" X 11"
(21 X 279mm), 500 SHT/20 LBS, 10 RMS/CS.
$753000844

Bidding On:

Brand/Make: Bosie FireWorx
Place of Origin: U.S.A.
Date of Delivery: 80 DAYS A,R.O.
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