

GENERAL SERVICE AGENCY
(Ahensian Setbision Hinirat)
Government of Guam
590 South Marie Drive, Ste. 219 ITC Bldg., Tamuning, GU 96913
Tel: 477-1710-13 Fax: 472-4217 / 475-1716/27

Accountability * Impartiality * Competence * Openness * Value

BID STATUS

October 26, 2020

TRIPLE 7

Attn: Chelsea Luo,

Authorized Representative

979 Army Drive, PMB 108

Barrigada, Guam 96913

Tel: (671) 688-1800 / Fax: (671) 637-0918

Email: yongqiaoluogu@gmail.com

BID INVITATION NO.: GSA-058-20

OPENING DATE: September 29, 2020

ARTS & CRAFTS EDUCATIONAL ACTIVITY SUPPLIES

The following is the result of the above-mentioned bid. Refer to the items checked below.

[] Cancelled (in its entirety), or partially cancelled due to:

- () Insufficient funds;
- () Change of specifications; or
- () Insufficient number of bidders.

[X] Rejected due to:

- () Late submission of bid;
- () No bid security or insufficient bid security;
- () Not meeting the delivery requirement as stated in the IFB;
- () Non-conformance with requirement of IFB;
- (X) **High price**
- () Others

REMARKS: See award listing

[X] Bid recommended for award: **Multiple Awards see attached listing.**

REMARKS: Thank you for your participation with this bid. Please send your authorized representative to pickup your original bid status and cashier check/bid bond or Standby Letter of Credit.


CLAUDIA S. ACFALLE
Chief Procurement Officer

Please Print

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT COPY (Re-fax to GSA)

Received By: _____

Date: _____

Company Name: _____

Fax to: 475-1727 or 472-4217

E-mail to: gsaprocurment@gsadoa.guam.gov

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	QTY/UOM		M80	MD	JMI	SUN-LEADER	TRIPLE 7
1.1	JUMBO CRAYONS 12-COLOR BOX 300 PIECES PER BOX Bidding On: Make: <u>BAZIC</u> Model: <u>2519</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days ARO</u>	67	EA.	108.71	<u>1.11</u>	107.99	155.00	40.00
2.1	FULLY WASHABLE LIQUID TEMPERA PAINTS – PINTS 6 COLOR SET ASSORTED COLORS Bidding On: Make: <u>Lakeshore</u> Model: <u>LM557</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days ARO</u>	67	EA.	30.84	31.50	<u>26.99</u>	38.00	32.00
3.1	NYLON-BRISTLE PAINT BRUSHES 10 BRUSHES PER SET Make: <u>BAZIC</u> Model: <u>3983</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days ARO</u>	67	EA.	13.82	<u>2.18</u> (12 PK)	13.99 12.04(Alt)	25.00	19.00
4.1	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, 9 X 12 CASE 50 SHEETS PER PACK ASSORTED COLORS Bidding On: Make: <u>PACON</u> Model: <u>Construction Paper 6503</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days</u>	67	EA.	84.25	1.50 (48/PK)	68.13	1.90	<u>1.25</u>
5.1	GLUE STICK, .28 OZ. STICK 12 PIECES PER SET Make: <u>BAZIC</u> Model: <u>2053</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days ARO</u>	67	EA.	7.60	<u>.90</u>	6.49	15.00	9.50
6.1	BLUNT-TIP SCISSORS 12 PIECE SET Make: <u>BAZIC</u> Model: <u>4430</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days ARO</u>	67	EA.	21.81	<u>.75</u> (5")	22.09	30.00	12.00
7.1	DOUGH SET, NON-TOXIC PLEASANT SMELLING, 6 PIECES SET BRIGHT COLORS Make: <u>BAZIC</u> Model: <u>3310</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days ARO</u>	67	EA.	83.53	<u>1.15</u>	74.99 51.44 (Alt.)	109.00	3.50

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	QTY/UOM	M80	MD	JMI	SUN-LEADER	TRIPLE 7	
8.1	BIG KNOB LEARNING PUZZLE SET 8 1/4" X 11 3/4" 3 HARDWOOD PUZZLES PER SET 5 PIECES WITH EASY GRIP KNOBS STORAGE RACK INCLUDED Make: <u>Lakeshore Learning</u> Model: <u>FF188</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days ARO</u>	47	EA.	65.11 6-8 Wks Did Not Meet	67.48	67.49	90.00	75.00
9.1	LEARNING SCIENCE ACTIVITY TUBS TUBS TO INCLUDE: 8 EXPERIMENT CARDS WITH ACTIVITIES BASE N NATIONAL SCIENCE STANDARDS MICROSCOPES PULLEYS 3-D MODELS FLIP BOOKS VOCABULARY CARDS FULL COLOR CHARTS 8 TUBS PER SET Bidding On: Make: <u>Lakeshore</u> Model: <u>DD350X</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days ARO</u>	47	EA.	624.90	589.00	584.99	699.00	NO BID
10.1	CRAFT BUTCHER PAPER ROLL 1000 FOOT ROLL ALL PURPOSE BROWN PAPER 36" WIDE Bidding On: Make: <u>PACON</u> Model: <u>Butcher Paper 63020</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days</u>	47	EA.	91.03	86.25	74.99	78.00	69.00
11.1	COLOR PENCILS 45.00 300 NON-TOXIC, PRE-SHARPEN PENCILS Make: <u>NASCO</u> Model: <u>9742564</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days ARO</u>	47	EA.	87.96	6.30	89.59		120.00
12.1	ARTS & CRAFTS SUPPLY CENTER 20 CLEAR-VIEW DRAWERS MISC. ARTS & CRAFTS SUPPLIES INCLUDED: (OVERFLOWING WITH FUZZY POM-POMS, WIGGLY EYES, PIPE STEMS ETC.) Bidding On: Make: <u>Lakeshore</u> Model: <u>Supply Center PP319</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>45 Days</u>	47	EA.	65.11	NO BID	67.49	95.00	65.00
13.1	SOFT & QUIET BUILDING BLOCKS BLOCKS MADE OF EXTRA THICK DURABLE FOAM BLOCKS HAVE SQUARE EDGES BLOCKS ARE SOFT AND LIGHTWEIGHT Bidding On: Make: <u>Lakeshore</u> Model: <u>Building Blocks LC1457</u> Place of Origin: <u>USA</u> Date of Delivery: <u>Days</u>	47	EA.	42.27	NO BID	40.49 11.60 (Alt.) Cubes Only	59.00	39.00