GENERAL SERVICE AGENCY
(Ahensian Setbision Hinirat)
Government of Guam
590 S. Marine Corps Drive, Suite 219, Tamuning Guam 96913
Tel: 477-1710-13  Fax: 472-4217 / 475-1716/27

Accountability * Impartiality * Competence *  QOpenness * Value

BID STATUS

August 28, 2019
MORRICO EQUIPMENT
Attn: Patrick Chargualaf, Director
Generator and Equipment Sales
197 Ypao Road,
Tamuning, Guam 96913
Tel: (671) 649-1946 / Fax: (671) 649-1947
Email; patrick(@morricoequipment.com; ross(@imorricoequipment.com

BID INVITATION NO.: GSA-022-19 OPENING DATE: May 30,2019

SCHOOL BUS PARTS & MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES
The following is the result of the above-mentioned bid. Refer to the items checked below.

[ 1 Cancelled (in its entirety), or partially cancelled due to:
( ) Insufficient funds:
( ) Change of specifications; or
( ) Insufficient number of bidders.

[ 1T Rejected due to:
( ) Late submission of bid;
No bid security or insufficient bid security;
Not meeting the delivery requirement as stated in the IFB;
Non-conformance with requirement of IFB;
High price
Others

P — -

REMARKS:

[X] Bid recommended for award: MULTIPLE AWARDS (See attached listing)
Morrico Equipment and Mid Pac Far East (This is an indefinite quantity bid)

REMARKS: Thank vou for yvour participation with this bid. Please send vour authorized representative to
pickup your original bid status and cashier check/bid bond or Standby Letter of Credit.

CLAUDIA S. ACFALLE
Chief Procurement Officer

}Qm INRVIRLTP

[Piease Print
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT RECEIPT

Received By:

Date:

Company Name:

] ‘ Fax to: 475-1727 or 472-4217
-pmsurement@gsad a.guam.gov




ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY/UOM MORRICO MPFE

1.1 DRIVE BELT/ALTERNATOR 08 EA. 51.00 61.35
P/N: 3972265 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

n
b
=

2.1 CIRCUIT BREAKER 10 AMP 10 EA. No Bid
P/N: TBB195403 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

=)
=a)
n

3.1 CIRCUIT BREAKER 15 AMP 10 EA. No Bid
P/N:TBB195404 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

o
r
n

4.1 CIRCUIT BREAKER 20 AMP 10 EA. No Bid
P/N: TBB195405 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

o
=]
L]

5.1 CIRCUIT BREAKER 30 AMP 10 EA, No Bid
P/N: TBB195407 VIN# 1TS88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

MPFE

6.1

7.1

8.1

9.1

10.1

CIRCUIT BREAKER 5 AMP
P/N: TBB195401 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

CIRCUIT BREAKER 7.5 AMP
P/N: TBB195402 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

OIL FILTER ENGINE
P/N: FGLF3970 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

LAMP TURN SIGNAL (AMBER)
P/N: TBB127568 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On;
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make :

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

LAMP WARNING LIGHT (AMBER) 77
P/N: TBB169430 VIN# 1TS88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

10

10

30

10

10

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

No Bid

No Bid

20.00

43.00

135.00

=2}
o
]

|o

=
tw
=

No Bid

27.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QrY/Uom

MORRICO

11.1

12.1

13.1

14.1

15.1

LAMP WARNING LIGHT (RED) 77
P/N: TBB169429 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

RELAY CONTROL 40A 12V
P/N: POK2642S VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

RELAY MICRO 208
P/N: TBB133526 VIN# 1T88§UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model;

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

RELAY MICRO AD SPST
P/N: TBB61201817 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

REVERSE LIGHT CLEAR LED
P/N: TBB127574 VIN# 1T8§UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

10

10

10

10

10

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA

EA

135.00

50.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/uom

MORRICO

MPFE

16.1

17.1

18.1

19.1

20.1

ROCKER SWITCH DOOR 20A
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

ROCKER SWITCH WARNING 20A
P/N: TBB52006564 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FUEL FILTER PRIMARY
P/N: FF63009 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FUEL FILTER SECONDARY
P/N: FS1065 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

HEADLIGHT ASSY.
P/N: A06-77995-000 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

10

10

10

10

10

EA

EA

EA

EA

EA

13.85

11.80

41.00

50.00

142.50

11.62

=)
B |
|

I.

28.73

27.12

135.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION QrY/uom

MORRICO

MPEE

211

221

23.1

24.1

25.1

TURN SIGNAL LAMP ASSY. 77 10
P/N: TBB169430 (AMBER})

VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345

2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BRAKE TAIL RED LIGHT 47 .\/q”,»-m

P/N: TBB159018 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

DIRECTIONAL SIDE LAMP (AMBER) 10
P/N: TL2100Y VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

LAMP STOP/TURN/TAIL RED LED 10
P/N: TBB163833 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

WIPER MOTOR FOR DRIVERS SIDE ASSY. 04
REF: SPR-E006-191 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

EA

10

EA,

EA.

EA.

EA,

135.00

No Bid

139.25

134,75

43.15

16.46

44.18

125.00

Page 5 of 44



ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

26.1

27.1

28.1

29.1

30.1

WIPER MOTOR FOR PASSENGER
SIDE ASSY. REF: SPR-E006-192
VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345

2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

WIPER LINK (MOTOR TO PIVOT SHAFT)
REF: TBB61250344 VIN# 1TS88UBE2XE1269345

2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

DOOR CYLINDER PNEUMATIC

REF: TBB175809 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345

2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

WIPER PIVOT PLATE

REF: 65009918 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345

2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID
P/N: 75-204

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

04

04

19

05

EA,

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA,

199.00

101.09

471.50

16.50

2,725400

77.85

14.75

No Bid
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

MPFE

311

321

33.1

34.1

35.1

MIRROR ASSY, -V, EYEMAX, BM, BBC
REF: 1003381 VIN# IBAKGCPASNF049085

2017 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

MIRROR ASSY. RRVVW, OPEN VIEW,
HAND AJB BBCV REF: 10032386
VIN# 1BAKGCPASNF049085

2017 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BLADES WIPER 18.00

REF: 01496827 VIN# 1BAKGCPASNF 049085

2017 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BULB HEADLIGHT TYC, AB29007C MEI
REF: 10034662 VIN# 1BAKGCPASNF049085

2017 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

LIGHT, CL, MRK, AMB, LED GROMMET

MOUNT

REF: 10004272 VIN# 1BAKGCPASNF049085

2017 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

05

05

60

20

EA

EA.

EA

EA.

EA.

335.00

463.50

15.85

[
[7)]
=

I..

18.00

290.00

12.6G0

13.00

14.50
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

36.1

37.1

38.1

391

40.1

LIGHT, CL, MRK, RED, LED GROMMET

MOUNT
VIN# 1BAKGCPASNF 049085

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

ENGINE COVER ASSY.
REF: TBB151759

FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS

MOD: 12085
VIN# 1T88N8E2451161125

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

MARKER LIGHTS CAT-EYE RED ASSY.

REF: BB1586288/BB10036124
VIN# 1BAAGCSASWF079706
1998 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

MARKER LIGHTS CAT-EYE AMBER
REF: BB1586296/BB10044009

VIN# 1BAAGCSASWEF079706

1998 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

ENGINE MOUNTS REAR

REF: 10008300 VIN# 1BAAGCSASWE079706

1998 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year;

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

20

05

20

20

10

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

18.00

No Bid

1
~X
n

30.00

1.855.00

9.15

9.15

24.22
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QrY/UoMm

MORRICO

MPFE

41.1

421

43.1

441

45.1

ENGINE MOUNTS FRONT ISOLATER
REF: 173093/CU3928900

VIN# 1IBAAGCSASWF079706

1998 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manuifacturer:
Year:

Make:

Madel:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

MIRRORS, NOMAD, FLAT, CONVEX RH & LH
REF: BB1638675 VIN# 1BAAGCSASWEF079706
1998 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

MIRROR, NOMAD, CONVEX, LOWER
REF: BB163863 VIN# 1BAAGCSASWEF (79706
1998 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BRACKET ASSY. MIRROR RH
REF: BB1641372 VIN# 1BAAGCSASWF079706
1998 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BRACKET ASSY. MIRROR POST
REF: BB1638634 VIN# 1BAAGCSASWEF079706
1998 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

05

20

20

10

10

EA.

EA,

EA.

EA,

EA.

50.00

46.50

52.25

127.95

46.50

65.00

45,43
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UoMm

MORRICO

46.1

47.1

48.1

49.1

50.1

WATER PUMP ASSY.
REF: CU3286278

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

MARKER LIGHT AMBER LED
GROMMET MOUNT

REF: 10004272 VIN# 1IBAKGCPASNF049085
2017 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

MARKER LIGHT RED LED GROMMET
MOUNT

REF: 10004273 VIN# 1BAKGCPASNF049085
2017 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

DEF TANK BUSHING KIT
REF: 16011065 VIN# 1BAKGCPASNF049085
2017 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

HEADLIGHT ASSY.
REF: 10044588 VIN# 1BAKGCPASNF049085
2017 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On;
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

06

20

20

12

02

EA.

EA.

EA,

EA.

EA.

127.00

17.95

17.95

111.75

267.00

110.00

243.00

Page 10 of 44



ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

MPFE

511

52.1

53.1

54.1

55.1

HEADLIGHT ASSY.
REF: 10055332 VIN# 1BAKGCPASNF049085
2017 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

SWTICH BATTERY MASTER
P/N: TBB159910 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345
2014 BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

RADIATOR ASSY. FOR 2014 THOMAS
BUILT SCHOOL BUS

ENGINE SER# 73500115

VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

SOLINOID 12 VOLTS (CONTINUOUS DUTY)
FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT88N8E2551161103

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

INJECTOR PUMP ASSY. FOR 2004
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT88N8D2141137560

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

02 EA.

10 EA.

02 EA.

10 EA.

01 EA.

267.00

125.00

1,914.00

4,290.00

243.60

1,451.00

33.50

2.600.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION QTY/UoM

MORRICO

MPFE

56.1

57.1

58.1

59.1

60.1

BATTERY GROUP 31 12 VOLTS 30
STUDDED POST

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BRAKE CHAMBER 30/30 10

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

ACCELERATOR RETURN SPRING 20
P/N: 1543628 UNIVERSAL

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

STARTER MOTOR ASSY. 02
FOR 2014 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
P/N: 410VDR8200571 VIN# 1T88UBE2XE1269345

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

EGR VALVE ASSY. W/GASKETS 02
FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# ITSSNSE2551161103

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

EA.

EA.

EA,

EA,

EA.

140.00

77.00

)
3
h

415.00

905.00

148.48

46.65

No Bid

369.40

655.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

aQrY/uom

MORRICO

MPFE

61.1

62.1

63.1

64.1

65.1

FRONT BRAKE DRUMS FOR 2004/5
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# I'T88N8D2541137559

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

REAR BRAKE DRUMS FOR 2004/5
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT88N8D2541137559

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

AIR COMPRESSOR ASSY. FOR 2004
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT8818D2141137560

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

WATER PUMP W/GASKET
P/N: 4089731

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

STOP SIGN ASSY. FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT88UBE2XE1269345

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Meodel:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

04

04

02

10

10

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

192.00

2,210,060

215.00

560.00

365.00

1.541.00

441.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UoM

MORRICO

MPFE

66.1

67.1

68.1

69.1

70.1

71.1

72.1

FRONT LEAF SPRING ASSY. FOR 1992

BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA4NF051488

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

RUBBER MATTING (SMOOTH)
125 THICKNESS 3847 X 13 47

RUBBER MATTING (RIBBED)
.125 THICKNESS 384” X 13 '4”

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

RUBBER MATTING (SMOOTH)
125 THICKNESS 336 X 387

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

RUBBER MATTING (SMOOTIH)
J25 THICKNESS 3367 X 327

RUBBER MATTING (RIBBED)
.125 THICKNESS 336” X 13 '4”

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

DRIVE SHAFT CENTER SUPPORT
BEARING FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT

SCHOOL BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

02

02

02

02

02

02

04

EA.

RIL.

RL,

EA.

816.00

No Bid

482.00

875.00

92.00

640.00

899.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

73.1

74.1

75.1

76.1

77.1

Delivery:

REAR LEAF SPRING ASSY.
FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:

Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

BACK UP ALARM FOR 1998
BLUEBIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSAI9TF069398

Bidding On:

Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FRONT LEAF SPRING FOR 1998 BLUE
BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA2WF079694

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

REAR LEAF SPRING ASSY. FOR
1998 BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSAZWF079694

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

CRANK SHAFT MAIN OIL SEAL FOR
2004 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2641137571

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model;
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

02

04

02

02

05

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

810.00

55.00

1,152.00

734,00

44.G0

25.50

587.00

79.99
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

78.1

79.1

80.1

81.1

82.1

KING PIN ASSY. LEFT SIDE FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

KING PIN ASSY. RIGHT SIDE FOR 2005

THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year,

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BACK UP LIGHT ASSY. FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model :

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BRAKE LIGHT ASSY. FOR 1998 BLUE
BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA9TF (69398

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BRAKE/TAIL LIGHT ASSY. FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL B US
VIN# 1T88B8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

02

02

04

04

04

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

352.00

336.00

8.25

40.50

11.75

12.90

]
i
=
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ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION qQrY/uom MORRICO MPFE

83.1 DOOR SWITCH FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT 04 EA. 17.00 10.99
SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

84.1 EMERGENCY EXIT HATCH ASSY, 10 EA. 260.00 305.00
FOR BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:
Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

851 8 WAY FLASHER FOR 1998 06 EA. 151.00 131.00
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA9TF069398

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

86.1 8 WAY FLASHER FOR 2005 06 EA. 91.00 80.00
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

87.1 POWER STEERING HOSE FOR 2005 05 EA. 57.50 37.20
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
(RESERVIOR TO PUMP SIDE)
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:
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ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION QrY/UoMm MORRICO MPFE

88.1 ABSORBANT PADS FOR OIL SPILLS 10 FA. 91.00 No Bid
(T151 SHEETS X 39 CM WHITE)

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:
Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

89.1 KING PIN ASSY. FOR 2004 02  EA. 270.00 263.00
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

90.1 TRANSMISSION ASSY. W/TCM FOR n EA. No Bid 9,155.00
2004 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2641137571

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

91.1 REAR BRAKE SLACK ADJUSTER FOR 06 EA. 84.00 80.00
2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

92.1 FRONT SLACKER ADJUSTER FOR 06 EA. 92.00 72.04
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QrY/UoMm

MORRICO

MPFE

093.1

94.1

95.1

96.1

97.1

DRIVERS LIGHT MONITOR FOR 2004
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2641137571

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

ALTERNATOR ASSY. FOR 2004 THOMAS
BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2641137571

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FRONT WHEEL BEARING W/RACE FOR
2004 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251166216 '

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

REAR WHEEL BEARING W/RACE FOR
2004 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FRONT AXLE SEAL FOR 2004
THOMAS SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

02

02

02

02

02

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

319.00

310.00

No Bid

No Bid

34.00

285.00

815.00

37.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

Qry/uom

MORRICO

98.1

99.1

100.1

101.1

102.1

FRONT AXLE HUBS (OIL BATH) FOR
2004 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1TT88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

COOLANT 50/50 FULLY FORMULATED

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FUEL TRANSFER PUMP FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FUEL FILTER SECONDARY FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

UNLOADING LIGHT RED FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

02

08

02

10

10

EA.

DR.

EA.

EA.

EA.

338.00

605.00

321.00

26.00

443.00

28.48

No Bid
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UoMm

MORRICO

MPFE

103.1

104.1

105.1

106.1

107.1

UNLOADING LIGHT AMBER FOR 2005

THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2551156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

HEADLIGHT SWITCH FOR 2005 THOMAS

BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BRAKE TREADLE VALVE FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA2ZWF079677

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

POWER STEERING HOSE PRESSURE
SIDE FOR 1998 BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS

VIN# 1BAAGCSA2ZWF079677

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FUEL TRANSFER PUMP FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

10 EA.

10 EA.

02 EA.

02 EA.

02 EA.

24.00

28.00

130.00

99.50

321.00

No bid

17.00

92.62

73.00

245.03
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UoM

MORRICO

108.1

109.1

1.110

111.1

112.1

1131

ALTERNATOR ASSY, FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

TURN SIGNAL SWITCH FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

ENGINE SPEED SENSOR FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

DOOR HANDLE FOR THOMAS BUILT
SCHOOL BUS (OUTSIDE)
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

DOOR HANDLE FOR THOMAS BUILT
SCHOOL BUS (INSIDE)
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

DRIVE BELT (SERPENTINE) FOR
2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88NED2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

02

04

05

05

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

938.00

117.00

No Bid

Neo Bid

221.00

62.00

No Bid

No Bid

59.29
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION QTY/UOM

MORRICO

114.1

115.1

116.1

117.1

118.1

EGR VALVE ASSY. FOR 2005 02
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

DRIVE BELT FOR 2004 THOMAS 05
BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2641137571

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model;

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

UPPER RADIATOR INLET PORT FOR 05
2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2551161103

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

TENSIONER BELT FOR 2004 05
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2441137570

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BRAKE CLEANER 20

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

870.00

60.00

135.00

No Bid

No Bid
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ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY/uom MORRICO MPFE

119.1 ELECTRICAL CLEANER 20 EA. 5.60 No Bid

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

120.1 WD-40 LUBRICANT 20 CS, 113.40 No Bid

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

(5]
b
th

121.1 SILICON GASKET MAKER 20 TU. No Bid

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

[y
—
i

122.1 ELECTRICAL TAPE 20 SE. No Bid

I.

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

123.1 TEFLON PLUMBING TAPE 20 EA. No Bid

[y
o
n

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

Page 24 of 44



ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

Qry/uom

MORRICO

MPEE

124.1

125.1

126.1

127.1

128.1

WIPER BLADES FOR 1998 BLUE
BIRD BUS
# BB1573682

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

WIPER ARMS FOR 1998 BLUE BIRD
BUS
# BB1561752

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

WIPER LINK CONNECTION LEFT
SIDE FOR 1998 BLUE BIRD BUS
# BB4304457

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

HORN ASSY. (HIGH) FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOIL. BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSASWF079673

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

HORN ASSY. (LOW) FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSASWF079673

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

20

20

40

05

05

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

21.50

130.00

16.50

22.00

22.00

18.07

13.50

24.00

24.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

VIPFE

129.1

130.1

131.1

132.1

133.1

INJECTOR PUMP FOR 2004 THOMAS

BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2441137570

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model;

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

TURN SIGNAL SWITCH FOR THOMAS

BUILT SCHOOL BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

DIP STICK ASSY. FOR THOMAS
BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88NSE2541161111

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

MARKER LIGHT (RED) FOR THOMAS

BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2541161111

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

MARKER LIGHT (AMBER) FOR
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2541161111

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:;

Make:

Moeodel:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

01

04

01

10

10

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.,

EA.

4,100.00

No Bid

1,313.00

No Bid

5.60

5.60
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

Qry/uom

MORRICO

MPFE

134.1

135.1

136.1

1371

138.1

MARKER LIGHT (RED) FOR
1998 BLUE BIRD BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA9TF (069398

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

MARKER LIGHT (AMBER) FOR 1998

BLUE BIRD BUS

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

PP-1 BRAKE VALVE W/BUTTON

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

AIR COMPRESSOR FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T8818D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BELT TENSIONER FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSAXWF079698

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

10

10

05

02

04

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

7.80

7.80

58.00

1,930.00

142.0

15.00

9.00

39.00

1,302.10

Page 27 of 44



ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UoMm

MORRICO

MPFE

1391

140.1

141.1

142.1

143.1

TURBO ASSY. FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT

SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

LOW COOLANT SENSOR FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

TROTTLE POSITION SWITCH FOR
2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

SWITCH MOMENTARY REF: 52004992

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Crigin:
Delivery:

BUZZER W/JAM NUT FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT88N8D221156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

02 EA.

04 EA.

02 EA,

05 EA.

05 EA.

2,250.00

129.00

o0
—
=

1.475.00

No Bid

11.00

30.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QrY/UoM

MORRICO

MPFE

144.1

145.1

146.1

147.1

148.1

AIR COMPRESSOR FOR 1998 BL.UE
BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

EMERGENCY WINDOW SWITCH FOR
2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT 88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

EMERGENCY WINDOW SWITCH/HANDLE
KIT FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS

VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

STOP LIGHT SWITCH FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IBAAGCSASTF169397

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

COOLANT TANK RESERVIOR FOR
1998 BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSASTF169397

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

04 EA.

04 EA.

10 EA,

06 EA.

02 EA.

No Bid

s
=

No Bid

27.00

461.00

1,200.00

25.00

16.95

50.00

453.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QrYy/uom

MORRICO

MPFE

149.1

150.1

151.1

152.1

1531

AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION
W/TORQUE CONVERTER (AT-545)
FOR 1998 BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSASTF169397

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:;

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

WATER SEPERATOR BOWL
REF: FSI19521

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FRONT BRAKE SHOES FOR 1992
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSASNF049085

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

REAR BRAKE SHOES FOR 1992 BLUE BIRD
SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSASNF049085

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

CENTER SUPPORT BEARING FOR
1998 BL.UE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IBAAGCSASTF169397

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

01

03

04

04

04

EA.

EA.

KT.

KT.

EA.

No Bid

48.00

125.00

103.00

86.00

4,145.00

54.11

46.93

69.49

54.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UoM

MORRICO

MPFE

154.1

155.1

156.1

1571

158.1

159.1

TRANSMISSION HARNES (INTERNAL)
FOR 2004 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS

VIN# 1'T88N8D2641137568

FAN CLUTCH ASSY. FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2251161138

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FRONT BRAKE DRUM FOR 1996
BLUE BIRD BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA1TF069377

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

U-JOINT FOR 1996 BLUE BIRD
SCHOOIL, BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA1TF069377

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BRAKE SLACK ADJUSTER 10 SPLINE

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

ALTERNATOR ASSY. FOR 1996
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA1TI069377

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

02

02

02

04

06

01

EA.

EA,

EA.

EA.

EA,

EA.

No Bid

462.00

158.00

No Bid

587.00

No Bid

869.00

41.49

540.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

160.1

161.1

162.1

163.1

TIMING COVER GASKET FOR 1996
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA1TF069377

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FRONT CRANK SHAFT SEAL FOR
1996 BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA1TF069377

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

TIMING CASE HOUSING W/GASKET
FOR 1996 BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA1TF069377

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER MOUNT

FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS

VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

164.1 FRONT AXLE SEAL INNER FOR 2005

THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D22551156216

Bidding On;
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

02

02

02

62

04

EA.

EA.

EA,

EA.

EA.

46.50

44.00

533.00

248.00

44.00

395.60

37.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

MPFE

165.1

166.1

167.1

168.1 CIRCUIT BOARD # 2 FOR 2005 THOMAS

169.1

REAR AXLE SEAL INNER FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1TB8N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BELT TENSIONER FOR 2005 THOMAS
BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

CIRCUIT BOARD # 1 FOR 2005 THOMAS

BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year;

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

INJECTOR PUMP ASSY. FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# I'T88N8D2251156216

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

04

04

01

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

42.00

139.00

257.00

249.00

1,720.00

42.50

95.00

242.00

1.315.00
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ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY/UOM MORRICO MPEE

170.1 TRANS FILTER INTERNAL FOR 05 EA. 49.00 26.00
2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E235116133

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

171.1 TRANS FILTER EXTERNAL FOR 05 EA. 27.00 1500
2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2351161133

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

172.1 TURBO ASSY.FOR 1998 BLUE BIRD 01 EA. 2,055.00 1.320.00
SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IBAAGCSASTF169397

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

173.1 WIPER ARM PANTOGRAPH ASSY. 04 EA. 116.00 No Bid
FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2351161133

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

174.1 RADIATOR ASSY. FOR 2005 THOMAS BUILT n EA. 4,455.00 2.200.00
SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2351161133

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

MPFE

175.1

176.1

177.1

178.1

179.1

RADIATOR ASSY. FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSCAS5TTF169397

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:
Place of Origin:

Delivery:

DRIVE BELT FOR 1998 BL.UE BIRD
SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSASTF169397

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FLASHER 2 PRONG SIGNAL LIGHT
FOR 1998 BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA6WF 079696

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FUEL FILTER PRIMARY FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSAGEF079696

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model :

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FUEL FILTER SECONDARY FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA6WF079696

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

01

06

10

06

06

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

1.420.00

72.00

43.00

2,608.00

52.00

36.74

N
(78
i

54.11
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

Qry/uom

MORRICO

MPFE

180.1

181.1

182.1

183.1

184.1

VALVE COVER GASKET FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA6WF079696

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

TIMING COVER GASKET FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA6WF 079696

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year;

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

AIR GOVERNOR FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA6WF(79696

Bidding On;:
Manufacturer:
Year:;

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

MARKER LIGHT BULBS # 194

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

BRAKE/TAIL LIGHT BULBS # 1156

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

06

04

06

10

20

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

9.80

47.00

~3
o
=

395.00

46.75

No Bid

No Bid
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ITEM

NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/Uom

MORRICO

MPFE

185.1

186.1

187.1

188.1

189.1

TURN SIGNAL LIGHT BULRBS # 1157

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Qrigin:
Delivery:

FRONT TIMING COVER SEAL FOR
2004 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2341137558

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

DOOR CYLINDER FOR 2004
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT88N8D2441137570

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

DIRECTIONAL DOOR SWITCH FOR
2004 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT88N8D2441137570

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER FOR
2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS\
VIN# 1T88NSE2551161103

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

20

02

02

02

04

EA,

EA.

EA.

EA,

EA.

.30

44.75

93.00

No Bid

104.00

No Bid

No Bid

60.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

MPFE

190.1

191.1

1921

193.1

194.1

REAR SHOCK ABSORBER FOR
2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2551161103

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FRONT BRAKE CHAMBER FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2551161103

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

REAR BRAKE CHAMBER FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88NBE2551161103

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:;

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

DOOR LEVER/PIVOT FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N82551161103

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

LOWER RADIATOR HOSE FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2551161103

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

04

04

04

05

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

95.00

51.00

70.00

32.00

21.00

62.00

No Bid

(2) 17.00
(b) 12.40
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UoMm

MORRICO

MPFE

195.1

196.1

197.1

198.1

199.1

200.1

UPPER RADIATOR HOSE FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS

VIN# 1T88NSE2551161103

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

ENGINE OIL 15-40WT CJ- 4
COMPATABLE

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

HOSE CLAMPS 5/16”

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

HOSE CLAMPS 3/8”

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Medel:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

HOSE CLAMPS 17

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year,

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

HOSE CLAMPS 2 47

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:

Delivery:

05

04

10

10

10

10

EA.

DR.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

250.00

2,860.00

li..a
=)

44.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY/UOM MORRICO MPFE

201.1 HOSE CLAMPS 3” 10 EA. 80 No Bid

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:;

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

202.1 AIR COMPRESSOR FOR 1992 01 EA. No Bid 1,150.00
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUIS
VIN# 1BAAGCSASNF049085

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

203.1 KING PIN ASSY.FOR 1992 01 EA. 486.00 325.00
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
REF: 120KK102

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

204.1 RADIATOR ISOLATER 06 EA. 11.0¢ 16.00
FOR 1998 BLUE BIRD SCHOOKL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSASWE(79706

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

205.1 LOW AIR SWITCH (60PSI) 10 EA. 24.50 35.00
REF: 8604

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QrY/uom

MORRICO

MPFE

206.1

207.1

208.1

209.1

2101

REVERSE LIGHT FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSASWF079706

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

OIL FILTER FOR BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS

VIN# 1BAAGCSASTF069379

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

OIL FILTER FOR THOMAS BUILT
SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1'T88N8E2541161111

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

TIE ROD LEFT SIDE FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA2WF079694

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

TIE ROD RIGHT SIDE FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA2ZWF079694

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Y ear:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

05

10

10

10

10

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

14,00

17.00

95.00

95.00

117.00

th
th
=

o
e
EEN

71.00

Page 41 of 44



ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MPFE

2111

2121

213.1

214.1

215.1

TURBO BOOT 45 DEGREE FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8E2541161111

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

SIGNAL FLASHER FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
REF: 11515961

VIN# 1BAAGCSA2ZWF079694

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

UNLOADING LIGHT (RED) FOR
1998 BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA2ZWF079694

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year;

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

UNLOADING LIGHT (AMBER) FOR
1998 BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1IBAAGCSA2WF079694

Bidding On;
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

INJECTOR PUMP FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA2WEK079694

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

05

05

05

05

01

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

No Bid

32.00

No Bid

No Bid

125.00

28.59

3.800.00
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ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

MPFE

216.%

217.1

218.1

219.1

220.1

221.1

SIMPLE GREEN CLEANSER
{GREEN COLOR)

STEERING DRAG LINK FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# IT88N8D2641137568

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

FRONT BRAKE SHOES FOR 1998
BL.UE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA2WF(0796%4

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

REAR BRAKE SHOES FOR 1998
BLUE BIRD SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1BAAGCSA2WF079694

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:

Year:
Make:
Model:
Place of Origin:
Delivery:

IGNITION SWITCH W/KEYS FOR
2005 THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2641137568

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

UNIVERSAL TURN SIGNAL SWITCH
W/CONNECTOR

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:;

Make:

Model;

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

05

DR.

EA.

KT.

KT.

EA.

EA.

No Bid

430.00

166.00

130.00

28.00

84.00

No Bid

29.56

127.00
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ITEM

NO.

DESCRIPTION

QTY/UOM

MORRICO

MPFE

2221

2231

224.1

225.1

226.1

227.1

FRONT BRAKE SHOES FOR 2005
THOMAS BUILT SCHOOL BUS
VIN# 1T88N8D2641137568

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

SAFETY RELEASE VALVE, REF: 284142N

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

STOP SIGN LIGHT BULBS, REF: 1004

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

HEADLIGHT BULBS, REF: H-3

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
DPelivery:

HEADLIGHT ASSY.
2017 BLUEBIRD BUS, MODEL: BB CV 33
REF: 10044588

Bidding On:
Manufacturer;
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

HEADLIGHT ASSY.
2017 BLUEBIRD BUS, MODEL: BB CV 33
REF: 10055332

Bidding On:
Manufacturer:
Year:

Make:

Model:

Place of Origin:
Delivery:

4

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

EA.

83.00

13.00

[
.
=

261.00

261.00

102.00

29.00

No Bid

No Bid

243.00

243.00
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